
HCSD ITEM 

#
DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL UNIT QTY AWARDED TO: UNIT COST UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

69410820
APPLICATORS, SINGLE, COTTON, 3", TIP, 

NON-STERILE, PACK OF 100

MOORE 69621 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
PACK 10

SCHOOL 

HEALTH
$1.11 $2.26 NO BID $0.61 $4.25 No Bid

69410515
BANDAGE, ADHESIVE, 2" X 4", STERILE, 

LATEX FREE, FLEXIBLE STRIP, BOX OF 50

SCH HEALTH 32120 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
BOX 20 MEDCO $3.26 NO BID NO BID $4.94 $12.00 $3.69

69410520 CUPS, WATER, PAPER, 3 OZ., PACK OF 100
SCH HEALTH 21209 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
PACK 10 QUILL $8.33 $2.49 $4.98 $5.30 $20.00 $4.29

69410007
PADS, GAUZE, 4" X 4", 12 PLY, STERILE, 

BOX OF 100

SCH HEALTH 27544 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
BOX 20

NASHVILLE 

EMS
$7.66 NO BID NO BID $7.03 $14.00 $4.99

69410005 SANITIZER, HAND, 16 OZ.

  (A.B.H.C. Fresh Scent 

Waterless or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)

EACH 125 MEDCO $3.75 NO BID 4.84 7.39 $8.00 No Bid

69410711 SANITIZER, HAND, 8 OZ.
KENTRON KHS448 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 100 MEDCO $1.91 $4.03 NO BID $5.91 $6.00 No Bid

PCARD (Fee): 

NO

Expiration: 3 

MONTHS

Expiration: 6 

MONTHS

Expiration: 6 

MONTHS

Expiration: 

12/31/25

Expiration: 12 

MONTHS

Expiration: 6 

MONTHS

Vendor: 

PYRAMID

Vendor: 

SCHOOL 

HEALTH

Vendor: 4PLUS 

ENTERPRISES

Vendor: 

NASHVILLE 

EMS

 Awarded To:  Multiple Vendors

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD 

(Fee): 

yes/none

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/5%

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

BID RESPONSE AWARD 

WORKSHEET 
 BID# 26-010

 DUE: August 14, 2025 @ 2:00PM

Vendor: 

MEDCO

Vendor: 

QUILL



69410140
SPONGE, GAUZE, 4" X 4", NON-STERILE, 12 

PLY, COTTON MESH, BOX OF 200

SCH HEALTH 27533 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
BOX 50

NASHVILLE 

EMS
$5.24 NO BID NO BID $5.47 $14.00 $4.19

69410810
VASELINE, INDIVIDUAL PACKETS, 5 GRAMS, 

BOX OF 144

VASELINE  (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
BX 20 MEDCO $7.84 NO BID NO BID $106.74 $22.00 No Bid

69410220

WIPES, ANTISEPTIC, FOR USE WITH 

HEARING AIDS & HEADPHONES, 

BENZALKONIUM CHLORIDE, BOX OF 100

PRO MED 49174 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
BOX 20 MEDCO $3.29 NO BID NO BID $3.96 $18.00 No Bid

69410840

WIPES, BABY, UNSCENTED, REFILL, PRE-

MOISTENED, ALCOHOL & LATEX FREE, 

PACK OF 80

NICE/CLEAN 49110 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
PACK 350 PYRAMID $2.47 NO BID 2.08 3.02 $8.00 $2.49

69410020

WIPES, FLUSHABLE, 40 WIPES PER 

CONTAINER, ALCOHOL & LATEX FREE - 

READY FLUSH JR

MEDLINE MSC263820 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 10

SCHOOL 

HEALTH
No Bid NO BID NO BID $4.49 $8.00 No Bid


