BID ON: A-CNP GROCERY & B-CNP SUPPLY - SCHOOL YR 2025-2026 & SUMMER FEEDING 2025
BID NO.: 25-02

Item Bidder Purchase Portion Brand Price
Number Specifications Unit Count & and Per
Weight Code Unit

PART A - CNP GROCERY

BEVERAGES:
1 WATER DISTILLED
Pack: 6/1 gal. Distilled water that has been ozonated and filtered to insure Butler Foods Case 3-1Gal  Prairie Farms 17199 $6.22
quality. Brand: Packer Label, Arlington Springs, Kentwood.

2 TEA
Ready to Drink Camellia Brand lightly sweetened iced Tea — Smart Snack. No Bid Received
Compliant 12/11.5 oz bottles per case; Shelf stable. Item:0705510100T,
or approved equal.

3 COFFEE CONCENTRATE
a. Javalive brand coffee concentrate — (6) - 64 ounces per case. Butler Foods Case 6 - 64 Oz. Javalive 5301 $180.63
GTIN: 10854484005337. Item: 5301 Mocha Latte; Trident Beverage
Brand or approved equal.

b. Javalive brand coffee concentrate — (6) - 64 ounces per case. Butler Foods Case 6 - 64 Oz. Javalive 5303 $180.63
GTIN: 10854484005900; Item: 5303 French Vanilla; Trident Beverage
Brand or approved equal.

4 BREAKFAST SMOOTHIE
Juice Alive Breakfast Smoothie Fruit & Yogurt Slushy Smoothie
each flavor - 8 ounces each - 48 oz per case; 1 Serving equals 1 .
meat/meat alternate, 1/2 cup fruit juice. Can be dispensed frozen or
served cold. Complies with USDA Smart Snacks Criteria. Trident
Beverage brand, or approved equal.
a. Blue Raspberry - GTIN:10854484005030 - Item: 1001 Butler Foods Case 6 - 64 Oz. Juice Alice 1001 $193.13

b. Strawberry Kiwi - GTIN: 10854484005047 - Item: 1002 Butler Foods Case 6 - 64 Oz. Juice Alive 1002 $193.13

c. Green Watermelon - GTIN: 10854484005054 - Item: 1003 Butler Foods Case 6 - 64 Oz. Juice Alive 1003 $193.13



Item
Number

Specifications

d. Cherry - GTIN: 10854484005085 - Item: 1006

e. Sour Apple - GTIN: 10854484005115 - Item: 1011

f. Strawberry Banana - GTIN: 10854484005320 - Item: 1014

g. Strawberry Lemonade - GTIN: 10854484005122 - Item: 1015

h. Coco Freeze - GTIN: 10854484005139 - Item: 1016

i. Cherry Cola - GTIN: 10854484005415 - Item: 1021

SLUSHIES

4 oz. serving. 100% juice slush in a pouch. Preservative free, no sugar
added, natural flavors and colors. Gluten and allergen free. Shelf stable
up to 12 months. 60 calories. Freeze, squeeze, rip and sip. Case 60.
Brand: Rips 100% Juice Slush by Cool Tropics or approved equal.
Flavors:

a. Kiwi Strawberry 876017002456, Product #12002-R4

b. Dragon Punch 876017002470, Product #12004-R4

c. Blue Raspberry 876017003118, Product #13001

d. Sour Apple 876017003101, Product # 13006

e. Cherry Limeade 876017003125, Product #13007

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

Purchase

Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

6 - 64 Oz.

6 - 64 Oz.

6 - 64 Oz.

6 - 64 Oz.

6 - 64 Oz.

6 - 64 Oz.

60 - 4 Oz.

60 - 4 Oz.

60 - 4 Oz.

Brand

and

Code

Juice Alive 1006

Juice Alive 1011

Juice Alive 1014

Juice Alive 1015

Juice Alive 1016

Juice Alive 1021

Cool Tropics 12002-R4

Cool Tropics 12004-R4

Cool Tropics 13001-R4

Price
Per
Unit
$193.13
$193.13
$193.13
$193.13

$193.13

$193.13

$28.67

$28.67

$28.67



Item
Number

10

11

Specifications

ORANGE MEDLEY JUICE

4.23 oz. serving. Meets 1/2 cup of red/orange vegetable requirement. A
medley of flavors (sweet potatoes, carrots and orange juice).

Great for bag lunches. Case 40/4.23 oz.

Brand: Juicy Juice Orange Medley or approved equal.

BREAKFAST ITEMS:
FROZEN BREAKFAST & BREADS
2.43 oz. single serving. Mini cinnamon creamy cheese bagels. Whole
wheat flour. Bagel filled with cinnamon creamy cheese, individually

wrapped, thaw and serve packages. 16 grams of whole grain per serving.

Case: 72 Brand: Pillsbury Mini Bagels Cinnamon Creamy Cheese
100-18000-38399-0, or approved equal.

BAGELS

2.43 oz. single serving. Mini strawberry creamy cheese bagels. WW

flour. Bagel filled with strawberry creamy cheese, individually wrapped,

thaw and serve packages. 16 grams of whole grain per serving. Case: 72

Brand: Pillsbury Mini Bagels Strawberry Creamy Cheese
100-18000-38413-3 or approved equal.

Cinnamon Raisin, WG, Bagel, Sliced, IW 2 oz,; Servings per case: 168;
Bake Crafters Brand Item: 746 or approved equal.

CALZONES

Country breakfast calzone. Individually wrapped.

4.5 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 48.

Brand: Albie's - IW item code 828 or approved equal.

DUTCH WAFFLE

51% Whole grain, 5" .2 Servings of grains. Shelf life up to one year
when stored properly. 300 Calories per serving. Case count: 48
Brand: Dutch Waffle 4521 by J&J Snack Foods or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

40 -4.23 Oz.

72 -2.43 Oz.

72 -2.43 Oz.

84 -2 0z.

48 -5 Oz.

48 -5 In.

Brand
and
Code

JuicyJuice 00066-00

Pillsbury 38399

Pillsbury 38413

Bake Crafters 746

Albies 828

J&J 4521

Price
Per
Unit

$12.31

$50.46

$50.46

$43.57

$63.64

$33.21



Item
Number

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

Specifications

GRANOLA, WG, IW
a. Cinnamon, 1 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 320. Brand: Bake
Crafters Item: 2264, or approved equal.

b. Golden Vanilla, 1 oz. serving; Servings per case: 320. Brand: Bake
Crafters Item:2268, or approved equal.

LOAF, CINNAMON CRUMB, WG, IW
3.2 OZ.; 48 Servings per case; Bake Crafters brand; Item:438 or
approved equal.

MUFFINS, WG, IW
a. Blueberry, 1.8 oz. serving; 72 per case; Bake Crafters Item: 1225 or
approved equal.

b. Chocolate, Chocolate Chip 2 oz. serving, 96 per case; Bake Crafters
brand; Item: 2156

PANCAKE BITES

Pancake bites WG. Individually wrapped.

Packed: 384/.51 oz. Serving size: 3. Servings per case: 128.
Brand: Rich's - WG item code 08066 or approved equal.

PANCAKE BITES, WG
Individually wrapped, 2.4 oz. serving size; 72 servings per case; Bake
Crafters Item:1673 or approved equal.

PANCAKE SANDWICH, MAPLE, WG, IW
Chicken, Sausage, and Cheese; 2.85 oz.; 168 servings per case; Brand:
Bake Crafters Item: 9126, or approved equal.

BREAKFAST PIZZA

Individually wrapped breakfast pizza, 51% WG crust with a red sauce and
NO PORK. The topping is made of beef sausage. Case 160/2.79 oz.
Brand: Wild Mike's #90502 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

320-1 Oz

320-1 Oz

48 - 3.6 Oz.

72 -1.8 Oz.

96 -2 Oz.

384 -.50z.

72 -2.4 Oz

168 - 2.85 Oz.

160 - 2.79 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Bake Crafters 2264

Bake Crafters 3127

Bake Crafters 438

Bake Crafters 1225

Bake Crafters 2156

Rich's 08066

Bake Crafters 1673

Bake Crafters 9126

Wild Mike's 90502

Price
Per
Unit

$144.89

$116.43

$43.01

$30.87

$46.17

$52.91

$59.68

$174.32

$130.81



Item
Number

19

20

21

22

23

24

Specifications

HOT POCKETS

Sausage, egg & cheese hot pocket. Individually wrapped.

4 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 24.

Brand: Nestle/Minors - IW item code 10043695031000 or approved equal.

YOGURT

a. 4 oz. serving. Value sized Original blended yogurt. Loose cups. Available
in 2 variety packs. No artificial colors or flavors. Gluten free. Case: 48
Brand: Yoplait Original Strawberry, Strawberry-Banana Yogurt
000-70470-17729-8 or approved equal.

b. 4 oz. serving. Value sized Original blended yogurt. Loose cups. Available
in 2 variety packs. No artificial colors or flavors. Gluten free. Case: 48
Brand: Yoplait Original Red Raspberry, Harvest Peach Yogurt
000-70470-17728-1 or approved equal.

APPLE FRITTER
2.4 oz. serving size (1 donut). Servings per case: 84.
Brand: Rich's product code 52152 or approved equal.

APPLE FRITTER, WG
3 oz. serving size. Packed: Individually wrapped. Servings per case: 60.
Brand: Bake Crafters item code 1262 or approved equal.

CINNAMON SWIRLS

Whole grain. Iced. Individually wrapped.

2.5 oz serving size. Servings per case: 72.

Brand: Bake Crafters item code 1687 or approved equal.

CINNAMON ROLL, WG
3.5 oz. serving size. Packed: Individually wrapped. Servings per case: 72.
Brand: Bake Crafters item code 1263 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase

Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

30-40z.

48 -4 Oz.

48 -4 Oz.

84-2.40z.

60 3 Oz.

72 -2.50Oz.

72 -3 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Nestle 43695968606

Yoplait 17729

Yoplait 17728

Rich's 52152

Bake Crafters 2162

Bake Crafters 1687

Bake Crafters 1263

Price
Per
Unit

$34.62

$27.07

$27.07

$59.86

$57.96

$60.08

$70.26



Item

Number

25

26

27

28

Specifications

CROISSANT, WG
Margarine, Round, Fully Sliced 2.2 o0z.; 150 Per Case; Bake Crafters Item: 1225
or approved equal.

FRENCH TOAST STICKS, WG
Individually wrapped, 3 oz. serving size; 88 per case; Bake Crafters
Item:456

FRUIT BOWLS

4 oz. serving. Fruit in 100% fruit juice. No high fructose corn syrup. All
natural fruit. Shelf stable, no refrigeration required. Case: 36/4 oz.
Brand: Dole Fruit Bowls or approved equal.

Flavors:

a. Cherry Mixed Fruit 100-38900-02062-7

b. Mixed Fruit 100-38900-03065-7
c. Tropical Fruit 100-38900-03048-0
d. Diced Peaches 100-38900-03073-2
e. Mandarin Oranges 100-38900-04208-7
f. Pineapple Tidbits 100-38900-00419-1
SNACKS
CRACKERS
.92 oz. serving. Whole wheat. Whole grain cereal pieces with a cheddar
flavoring. 70% less fat than regular potato chips. Case: 60

Brand: Simply Chex Cheddar Snack Mix 100-16000-31932-2 or approved
equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

150-2.2 Oz.

88 -3 0z.

36 -4 0Oz
36 -4 0z
36 -4 0z.
36 -4 0z.
36 -4 0z.

36 -4 0z

60 - .92 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Bake Crafters 869

Bake Crafters 456

Dole 2062
Dole 3065
Dole 3048
Dole 3073
Dole 4208

Dole 0419

Simply Chex 31932

Price
Per
Unit

$67.25

$70.64

$24.81

$24.81

$21.06

$27.00

$27.00

$21.06

$37.77



Item
Number

29

30

31

32

33

34

Specifications

YOGURT SNACK MIX

1.03 oz. serving. Whole wheat. Whole grain cereal pieces with strawberry

and yogurt flavoring. 70% less fat than regular potato chips. Case: 60

Brand: Simply Chex Strawberry Yogurt Snack Mix 100-16000-31937-7 or

approved equal.

CHEESE BITES

240/1 oz., Premium quality cheese bites, fresh baked with 51% WG
rich four and filled with mozzarella cheese.

Brand: Wild Mike's or approved equal.

CHEESE STICKS

Cheddar. Individually wrapped.

1 oz. serving size. Case: 168.

Brand: Bongards - IW item code 402911 or approved equal.

MINI DONUTS
a. 3.2 oz. serving size. Packed: 6 pack. Servings per case: 72.
Brand: Bake Crafters item code 1931 or approved equal.

b.Super Stars Mini Powdered Donut Holes WG CORE Foodservicel
3 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 60. Brand: SBI item code 9300

¢. Super Stars Mini Powdered Donut Holes CORE Foodservice!|
3 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 60. Brand: SBI item code 9301

Chocolate Enrobed, WG.
3.2 oz. serving size. Packed: 6 pack. Servings per case: 72.
Brand: Bake Crafters item code 1929 or approved equal.

Whole Grain Breaded Italian Mozzarella Stick.
0.9 oz. serving size. Packed: 5 pcs. Servings per case: 8/50 ct.
Brand: The Father's Table item code 77072 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

60 - 1.03 Oz.

240 -1 Oz.

168 - 1 Oz.

60- 3 Oz.

60- 3 Oz.

72 -3.2 Oz

8-31b.
About 85
servings/case

Brand
and
Code

Simply Chex 31937

Wild Mike's 11003

Bongard's 402911

Super Bakery 9300

Super Bakery 9301

Bake Crafters 1939

Rich's 65219

Price
Per
Unit

$37.77

$86.83

$51.43

$67.94

$67.94

$79.94

$89.85



Item
Number

35

36

37

Specifications
LUNCH
ASIAN ENTREES
Mandarin Orange Chicken Bowl. Individually wrapped.

9 oz. serving size. Pack size: 36-9 oz. bowls. Servings per case: 36.

Brand: Yang's item number 16668-1 or approved equal.

BBQ Teriyaki Chicken Rice Bowl. Individually wrapped.

9 oz. serving size. Pack size: 36-9 oz. bowls. Servings per case: 36.

Brand: Yang's item number 16667-4 or approved equal.

General Tso's Chicken Rice Bowl. Individually wrapped.

9 oz. serving size. Pack size: 36-9 oz. bowls. Servings per case: 36.

Brand: Yang's item number 16669-8 or approved equal.

Chicken Fried Rice Bowl. Individually wrapped.

9 oz. serving size. Pack size: 36-9 oz bowls. Servings per case: 36.

Brand: Yang's item number 16679-7 or approved equal.

Mandarin Orange Chicken.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b chicken, 6-36 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 192.

Brand: Yang's item number 15552-4 or approved equal.

Mandarin Orange Chicken, Jr.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-36 oz. sauce.

Servings per case: 192.
Brand: Yang's item number 15555-5 or approved equal.

General Tso's Chicken.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-36 oz. sauce.

Servings per case: 192.
Brand: Yang's item number 15563-0 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

36 9 Oz.

36-90Oz.

36-90z.

192 -3.6 Oz.

192 - 3.6 Oz.

192 -3.6 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Yang's 16668-1

Yang's 16667-4

Yang's 16679-7

Yang's 15552-4

Yang's 15555-5

Yang's 15563-0

Price
Per
Unit

$113.79

$114.52

$114.52

$211.42

$195.85

$211.42



Item
Number

Specifications

Sweet & Sour Chicken.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-36 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 192.

Brand: Yang's item number 15551-7 or approved equal.

Sweet Chili Thai Chicken.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-36 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 192.

Brand: Yang's item number 15550-0 or approved equal.

Buffalo Hot Ling's Chicken.

3.6 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-30 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 192.

Brand: Yang's item number 15558-6 or approved equal.

Chicken Nuggets. No sauce. Whole muscle.

2.5 oz. serving size. Pack size: 7-5 1b. chicken. Servings per case: 224.

Brand: Yang's item code 15566-1 or approved equal.

BBQ Teriyaki Chicken.

2.4 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-32 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 240.

Brand: Yang's item code 15554-8 or approved equal.

Gluten Free BBQ Teriyaki Chicken.

2.4 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-32 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 240.

Brand: Yang's item code 15559-3 or approved equal.

Spicy Sichuan Chicken.

2.4 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-5 1b. chicken, 6-32 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 240.

Brand: Yang's item code 15556-2 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase

Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

192 -3.6 Oz.

192 - 3.6 Oz.

224 -2.5 Oz.

240 - 2.8 Oz.

240 -2.8 Oz.

240 - 2.8 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Yang's 15551-7

Yang's 15550-0

Yang's 15566-1

Yang's 15554-8

Yang's 15559-3

Yang's 15556-2

Price
Per
Unit

$211.42

$211.42

$227.48

$203.21

$205.04

$202.58



Item
Number

50

51

52

53

54

55

Specifications

Edamame Kung Pao Chicken.

3.8 oz. serving size. Pack size: 6-4 1b. chicken, 6-16 oz. sauce, 6-36 oz.
vegetables. Servings per case: 182.

Brand: Yang's item code 15557-9 or approved equal.

BBQ Teriyaki Chicken Strips, No Sauce.
2 oz. serving size. Pack size: 8-5 chicken. Servings per case: 320.

Brand: Yang's item code 15565-4 or approved equal.
Brand: Advance Pierre 3853 or approved equal.

Chow Mein (51% Whole Grain).

2.8 oz. serving size. Pack size: 4-2.5 1b. chow mein, 4-16 oz. sauce.
Servings per case: 80.

Brand: Yang's item code 00301-6 or approved equal.

Vegetable Fried Rice.
5.36 oz. serving size. Pack size: 1-28 1b. rice & vegetables. Servings per case: 83.
Brand: Yang's item code 15582-1 or approved equal.

Steamed Long Grain White Rice.
4.5 oz serving size. Pack size: 5-5 Ib. rice. Servings per case: 88
Brand: Yang's item code 00306-1 or approved equal.

BUFFALO BITES
Whole muscle. Individually wrapped.

4 pcs/4.4 oz. serving size. Packed: 4/5 LB. Servings by case: 72.
Brand: Proview item code 64230-WG or approved equal.

CALZONES

Pizza Calzone. Individually wrapped.

5 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 48.

Brand: Albie's - IW item code 829 or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

182-3.8 Oz.

80 - 2.8 Oz.

83 -5.36 Oz.

72 -4.4 Oz.

48 -5 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Yang's 15557-9

Yang's 00301-6

Yang's 15582-1

ProView 64230

Albies 829

Price
Per
Unit

$220.15

$52.72

$97.04

$105.00

$63.84



Item
Number

56

57

58

59

Specifications

CHIC BITES

Chic Bite. Whole muscle. Individually wrapped.

4 pcs/4.4 oz. serving size. Packed: 4/5 LB. Servings by case: 80.
Brand: Proview item code 64030-WG or approved equal.

PIZZA
a. Cheese Pizza, Wedge. Individually wrapped

5.49 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 90.
Brand: Wild Mike's Pizza #90501 or approved equal.

b. Pepperoni pizza, Wedge.
Individually wrapped. Serving size: 5.49 oz. Servings per case: 90.
Brand: Wild Mike's Pizza #90500 or approved equal.

HOT POCKETS

a. Pepperoni pizza hot pocket. Individually wrapped.

4 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 24.

Brand: Nestle/Minors - IW item code 10043695033044 or approved equal.

b. Mozzarella beef meatball hot pocket. Individually wrapped.
4 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 24.
Brand: Albie's - IW item code 10043695036005 or approved equal.

¢. Ham & Cheese; 4 oz. serving size. Servings per case: 24.
Brand: Albie's - IW item code 10443695032007 or approved equal.

Pretzels Dogs, WG ES Foods 4 oz. serving; 100 per case; :
GTIN: 10693392006834, ES Foods Item:25603, or approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase

Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion

Count &

Weight

4-51b.

90 - 5.49 Oz.

30-40z.

30-40z.

30-40z.

30-40z.

100 - 4 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

ProView 64630

Wild Mikes 90501

Wild Mikes 90500

Nestle 43695957389

Nestle 43695825909

Nestle 43695657678

ES Foods 25603

Price
Per
Unit

$100.00

$113.73

$118.10

$34.56

$34.56

$34.56

$115.12



Item
Number

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

Specifications

PREPACKAGED MEAL KITS
Item Kit #: BC 1031; Kellogg Brand; Frosted Flakes 10z; Kellogg's Tiger
Bites 10z; 100% Fruit Juice 4.230z; Champion Food Item:BC 1091 or
approved equal

Item Kit #: BC1032 Kellogg Brank; Apples Jacks 1 oz; Kellogg's Tiger
Bites 1oz; 100% Fruit Juice 4.23 oz. Champion Food Item: BC1032
or approved equal

Item Kit #:BC 1034 Kellogg Brand; Fruit Loops 1 oz; Kellogg's ;
Tiger Bites 1oz 100% Fruit Juice 4.23 oz Champion Food Item:BC 1034
or approved equal

Item Kit #:1035; Strawberry Pop Tart 1 0z; MIM Honey Gram 1oz;
100% Fruit Juice 4.230z; Kellogg Brand; Champion Food Item:BC 1035

Item Kit #:1036; Cinnamon Pop Tart 1 oz; MJM Honey Gram 1oz;
100% Fruit Juice 4.230z; Kellogg Brand; Champion Food Item:BC 1036

Item Kit#: 1037; Cinnamon Bun Crunch mania 1oz; 100% Fruit Juice 4.230z.;

Kellogg Brand; Champion food Item: BC 1037 or approved equal

Item Kit #: 1038 French Toast Crunch mania 10z; 100% Fruit Juice 4.230z;
Kellogg Brand; Champion Food Item:1038 or approved equal

Item Kit #: BC1049: Scooby & Cheez-it 10z;Sunshine Cheez-its .750z; 100% .

Fruit Juice 4.230z; Kellogg Brand; Champion Food Item: BC 1049

Item Kit#: LC 96K8 Jacks Links Sweet BBQ Chicken Tender 10z; Sun Opta ;
Honey Roasted Sunflower kernels 1.20z; Rocking Ola Kettle Corn Crunch 22g;
Ocean Spray Craisins 1.120z; Wango Mango or Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice

6.75 oz; Champion Food Item: LC 96K8 or approved equal

Bidder

No Bid Received

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

44/cs

44/cs

48/cs

48/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

Brand
and
Code

Champion BC-1032

Champion BC-1034

Champion BC-1035

Champion BC-1036

Champion BC-1037

Champion BC-1038

Champion BC-1049

Champion LC-96k8

Price
Per
Unit

$56.65

$56.65

$61.80

$61.80

$51.50

$51.50

$135.00

$135.00



Item
Number

69

70

71

72

73

74

75

Specifications

Item Kit #:10K8; Gilman Cheddar Cheese Bar 10z; Gilman Cheddar Cheese Bai
loz; Buddy Fruit 4.50z; Rockin Ola Kettle Corn Crunch 22g; Wango Mango or
Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice 6.750z; Champion Food Item: LC 10K8 or approved
equal

Item Kit#: LC 23K8; Summer Berry Yogurt Lunch Kit; Shelf Stable Strawbe
Yogurt Cup 40z; Sun Opta Honey Roasted Sunflower Kernels 1.20z; Tiger Bits ;
loz; Flavored Craisins 1.120z;Wango Mango or Gragon 100 V-Blended.

Juice 6.750z; Champion Food Item: LC23KS8 or approved equal

Item Kit #: LC 24K8; Vanilla Yogurt Lunch Kit; Shelf Stable Vanilla Yogurt
40z; Sun Opta Honey Roasted Sunflower Kernels 1.20z; Chocolate Tiger Bites
loz; Flavored Craisins 1.120z; Wango Mango or Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice
6.75 oz; Champion Food Item: LC 24K8 or approved equal

Item Kit #: LC Dutch Apple Yogurt Lunch Kit; Shelf Stable Dutch Apple Y
cup 4oz;Sunflower kernels 1.20z; Flavored Craisins 1.12 oz; Wango Mango or
Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice 6.75 oz; Champion Food Item: LC or approved
equal

Item Kit #: LC 12K8; Pizza Meal Kit; Sun Opta Honey Roasted Sunflower ker
1.2 oz; White Cheddar Cheese Cup 2.0 oz; Gilman Mozz Cheddar Plank 1oz;
MIM Wheat Cracker 22g; Ocean Spray Craisins 1.12 oz; Wango Mango or
Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice 6.75 oz; Champion Food Item: LC 12K8 or
approved equal

Item Kit #: LC 20K8: Honey Turkey Meal Kit; Clean label Honey Turkey Stic
1.1 oz; Gilman Swiss Plank 1oz; MJM Honey Cracker 22g; Ocean Spray Craisins
1.12 oz; Wango Mango or Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice 6.75 oz; Champion
Food Item: LC 20KS8 or approved equal

Item Kit #: LC 21K8; Beef & Ranch Cheddar Meal Kit; Clean Label Beef Sti
1.1 oz.; Gilman Ranch Cheddar Cheese Plank 1 oz.; MJIM Wheat Cracker 22g;
Ocean Spray Craisins 1.12 oz.; Wango or Gragon 100 V-Blended Juice 6.75 oz.;
Champion Food Item: LC 21K8 or approved equal

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase

Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

40/cs

Brand
and
Code

Champion LC-10k8

Champion LC-23k8

Champion LC-24k8

Champion LC-25k8

Champion LC-12k8

Champion LC-20k8

Champion LC-21k8

Price
Per
Unit

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00



Item
Number

76

71

78

79

80

81

Specifications

Item Kit #: LC 01KS8; Tortilla Strips, Cheese & Salsa Kit; Sun Opta
Honey Roasted Sunflower kernels 1.2 oz.; Yellow Cheddar Cheese Cup,
1 oz.; Festida Tortilla Strips 1.25 oz; Red Gold Salsa 1.5 oz.; Flavored
Ocean Spray Craisins 1.12 oz.; Sunset or Ruby Rusher 100 V-Blended

Juice 4.23 oz.; Champion Food Item: LC 01K8 or approved equal

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
BREADSTICKS, CHEESE
112/2 oz., Premium quality cheese breadsticks, fresh baked with 51% WG
rich flour and filled with mozzarella cheese.
Brand: Wild Mike's or approved equal.

BREADSTICKS, GARLIC WG

7" Heat & Serve, 1.96 0z.;144 Servings per case Bake Crafters Brand Item:

1637, or approved equal

CORNBREAD BOWL, WG.
2.5 oz. serving size. Packed: 1 pc. Servings per case: 60.
Brand: Bake Crafters item code 2178 or approved equal.

CORN BREAD MIX, WG
6 - 5# pouches/case.
Brand: Pioneer 212643 or approved equal.

ROLLS
a. Rolls, WW.

Serving Size: 1.5 oz. Case: 120
Brand: Marzetti Sister Schubert's item code 62205 or approved equal.

b. Rolls, Dinner, WG, Low Sodium
2.5", 1 oz.; 72 Servings per case; Brand: Bake Crafters [tem:2574 or
approved equal.

Bidder

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Butler Foods

Purchase
Unit

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Case

Portion
Count &
Weight

40/cs

112 -2 Oz.

144 - 1.96 Oz.

60 - 2.5 Oz.

6-5Lb.

Brand
and
Code

Champion LC-01k8

Wild Mikes 11001

Bake Crafters 1637

Bake Crafters 2178

Pioneer 212643

120 - 1.5 Oz. Marzetti Sis Schubert

192 -1 Oz.

62205

Bake Crafters 2574

Price
Per
Unit

$135.00

$78.55

$52.03

$43.37

$53.79

$26.65

$54.97



Item
Number

82

83

84

Bidder Purchase
Specifications Unit

LIGHT RANCH SAUCE

Cup, individual serving, foil top peel back lid, individual container to Butler Foods Case
contain nutritional information, no high fructose corn syrup, less than

75 calories per serving, less than 135 mg of sodium per serving, 0 grams

of trans fat, 100-1 oz. (28 grams), or 120 1 oz. servings per case.

Brand: Diamond Crystal House Blend 70808, Marzetti's 83985 or

approved equal.

PART B-CNP SUPPLY

DECARBONIZER

Liquid concentrate, safe for aluminum and other soft metals. Product No Bids Received
can be used in food service area and on cooking utensils to lift carbon

grease buildup without scrubbing. Product must have 0 on all MSDS

(Flammability, Health and Reactivity) and be safe for sewers and storm

drains. Material Safety Data Sheet is required with bid proposal. The

dilution ratio for product must be submitted with bid. Bidder must submit

a written breakdown based on the ratio submitted using their product to

show the actual cost per ounce. Pack: 4/1 gallon case.

Brand: Duo-Zyme 555 by United Labs or approved equal.

FOOD PACKAGING SYSTEM

Bagging System to include heavy duty tape sealer and bag stand. No Bids Received
Custom rubber feet.

Brand: Ekon-O-Pac EPAC4 or approved equal.

Supplies to be used with food packaging system:

Cold sealing tape - colors: red No Bids Received
Cold sealing tape - colors: blue No Bids Received
Cold sealing tape - colors: green No Bids Received

Cold sealing tape - colors: yellow No Bids Received

Portion
Count &
Weight

100 - 1 Oz.

Brand
and
Code

Diamond/Dyma 77013

Price
Per
Unit

$25.37



Item
Number

Specifications

Cold sealing tape - colors: orange

Hot sealing tape

CD78NV -7 X 8 bags, 5000 per case
MD78V -7 X 8 bags, 5000 per case

HB78V - Vented 7 X 9, 5000 per case
HB78MP - Mult-vented 7 X 9, 5000 per case

BB91GNV -9 X 11, 3000 per case
Brand: Ekon-O-Pac Food Packaging System or approved equal.

Bidder

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

Purchase
Unit

Portion
Count &
Weight

Brand
and
Code

Price
Per
Unit
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