BID ON: HARDWARE - MAINTENANCE & RENOVATIONS - AS NEEDED UNTIL 3/31/25
BID NO: 25-12
OPENED: FEBRUARY 27, 2025 @ 10:00 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND/MODEL DELIVERY TIME
AFTER RECEIPT OF
PURCHASE ORDER

1 Kick down door stops, 5 " projection, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $6.99 Tell DT100008 1-5 Days
Rockwood #460 Finish US26D Ives 452 Autry Greer & Sons $8.92 National Hardware #184-234 10 Days

2 Full Mortise Hinge Set. Three (3) hinges per set. Autry Greer & Sons $14.78 Tell #HG1000200 10 Days
4-1/2" X 4-1/2" USP Finish. Hager BB1279 NRP Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $54.00 Tell HG100316 1-5 Days
or approved equal.

3 Half Surface Hinge Set. Three (3) hinges per Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $179.00 BB1173-NRP 1-5 Days
set. 4-1/2" BB173PC-NRP or approved equal.

4 Aluminum Kickplates. US28 Finish .050 ga. Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $18.50 Schlage #SC8400-PA28 1-5 Days
8" X 34" or approved equal. Autry Greer & Sons $21.67 Schlage #SC8400-PA28 10 Days

5 Aluminum Kickplates. US28 Finish .050 ga. Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $18.50 Schlage #SC8400-PA28 1-5 Days
8" X 30" or approved equal.

6  Pulls - 3" centers, Finish chrome, Taco #AL4483 Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $1.99 Amerock #BP865CS26 1-5 Days
or approved equal.

7  Pulls - 4" centers, Finish chrome, Taco #AL4483 or Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $2.30 Amerock #943SCH 1-5 Days
approved equal.

8  Push plate, 4" X 16" Hager #305-US28 Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $13.10 Tell DT100072 1-5 Days

9  Push and pull plate, 4" X 16" with 8" pull, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $26.60 Brinks BC41004 1-5 Days
Hager #33G-US28 Autry Greer & Sons $32.18 Brinks #BC41004 10 Days

10 Full Surface Adjustable Spring Hinge, Autry Greer & Sons $23.75 Ace Trading BH-9#01-3850-132 10 Days
Rust Resistant, zinc plated, National Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $27.40 Ace 5395887 1-5 Days

MFG. 115-055-100.



ITEM DESCRIPTION BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND/MODEL DELIVERY TIME
AFTER RECEIPT OF
PURCHASE ORDER

11  Coat & Hat Hook, Aluminum Ives SP571A92 Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $3.55 Ace 5292743 1-5 Days
Autry Greer & Sons $3.70 Ace (2pk.) 5617808 10 Days

12 Concave Wall Mount Door Bumper, Autry Greer & Sons $4.40 Tell #DT100084 10 Days
Ives #WS407-CCV-32D or approved equal. Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $4.60 Tell #DT100084 1-5 Days

13 Aluminum Shelf Standard, 12', Knape & Vogt 255AL,; Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $1.90 Knape & Vogt PK255ZC-24 1-5 Days

or approved equal.

14 Aluminum Supports, Knape & Vogt #256 AL-NAT Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $0.46 Knape & Vogt 256P BR 1-5 Days

15 Wrought Steel BRKT, 10" length, nickle plate, 24 per box Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $6.60 Knape &Vogt 208 TI 300 1-5 Days
with screws, Knape & Vogt #204; or approved equal.

16  Wrought Steel BRKT, 12" length, Nickle plate, 24 per box Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $6.60 Knape &Vogt 208 TI 300 1-5 Days
with screws, Knape & Vogt #204; or approved equal.

17  Chain, #35 sash, galvanized 100"/roll Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $64.00 Koch 781606 1-5 Days
Campbell #089352 Autry Greer & Sons $159.00 Koch MFR #781606 10 Days

18  Chrome Wall Bumper, US28 finish, Rockwood #406; or Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $4.66 Tell DT100085 1-5 Days
approved equal. Autry Greer & Sons $6.30 National Hardware #n215-848 10 Days

19  Chrome Door Holder, Four hole kickdown, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $8.30 National HD N273-557 1-5 Days
Taco #SB1235; or approved equal. Autry Greer & Sons $9.22 Ace Trading BH-9#01-3028-650 10 Days

20 Door Stop, 1-5/16" x 1-3/8", US28 finish, Taco #DS438; Autry Greer & Sons $4.72 Ace Trading BH-9#01-3028-433 10 Days
or approved equal. Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $8.50 Tell DT100032 1-5 Days



ITEM DESCRIPTION BIDDER UNIT COST BRAND/MODEL DELIVERY TIME
AFTER RECEIPT OF

PURCHASE ORDER

21 Door Stop, 1" x 1-3/8", chrome, US28 finish, Autry Greer & Sons $3.75 Ace Trading BH-9#01-3028-438 10 Days
Taco #DS436; or approved equal. Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $5.99 Tell DT100033 1-5 Days

22 Tilt Mirror, 18 gauge SS frame, tilts full 7", 18" x 30", No Bid
Bradley #740-1830 No Bid

23 Channel Frame Mirror, 20 gauge, SS channel, 16" x 24", No Bid
Bradley #781-1624; or approved equal. No Bid

24 Hinge, cabinet door, 3/8" x 3/8", Bright chrome finish, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $6.30 Amerock BPR3428G9 1-5 Days
Ameroc BP3428-26; or approved equal.

25 Hinge, cabinet door, Flush mount, Satin chrome finish, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $2.99 Amerock BPR3429-G10 1-5 Days
Ameroc BP3429-G10; or approved equal.

26  Door pull, commercial duty, aluminum finish, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $7.60 Ace 5398623 1-5 Days
Taco #TA-P531-ALO or approved equal.

27 Door knobs, 2-1/4" round, solid brass, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $9.50 Ace 5045740 1-5 Days
with spindle, US26D dull chrome finish,

Prgressive #2600-26D or approved equal.

28 Door knobs, 2-1/4" round, solid brass, Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $9.50 Ace 5045740 1-5 Days
with spindle, U53 polished brass finish, Autry Greer & Sons $12.41 Ace Trading SKU 5045740 10 Days
Progressive #2600-3 or approved equal.

29  Drawer/Cabinet Lock, 2-1/16" X 1-1/4" KD, CMD, TA711 No Bid
or approved equal. No Bid

30 36" H.D. Door Sweeps, Hager 750S, CLR, Neoprene Ladd Supply Co., Inc. $4.99 M-D Building 05090 1-5 Days
or approved equal. Autry Greer & Sons $12.69 M-D Hardware MFR #68247 10 Days

Proposal form shall be filled out in full. Each item quoted shall be described by brand name and model number. Each

item shall be assigned a unit cost. Failure to provide this information on proposal form may be cause for rejection of

bid.

If quoting a substitute, bidder must include specifications for the purpose of evaluation. Failure to provide this information
with proposal form may be cause for rejection.
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