
 
  
 
         

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
SCHOOL ACTIVITIES 

 
 

CLUB INFORMATION 
 

 
Bonjour! French Club meets Friday at lunch in room 218. Grab your lunch and head to room 218 
at 12:30! (Ekberg 10/6-7) 
 
Link Leaders, We will be having a meeting next Wednesday during 2nd period. Pick up 
permission slips from rooms 303, 614, or 617. Due next Tuesday. (Ekberg 10/6-7) 
 
FCA - Fellowship of Christian Athletes meets today in room 607. Come for pizza and to learn 
more about the Christian faith ... FCA - Fellowship of Christian Athletes every Thursday in room 
607. (Dearborn 10/6) 
 
UNICEF Club is dedicated to raising awareness about children in need around the world.  
 If you are interested in joining a club that is making a positive impact for kids everywhere, 
we will be meeting today in room 214 at lunch.  Everyone is welcome.   
 
El Club UNICEF se dedica a crear conciencia sobre los niños necesitados en todo el mundo. 
 Si estás interesado en unirse a un club que tiene un impacto positivo para los niños de todo el 
mundo,nos reuniremos hoy en el salón 214 a la hora del almuerzo. Todos son bienvenidos. 
(Maldonado 10/5-6) 
 
Today, the Inclusion Club will be planning for upcoming holidays:  Samhain (Sam-hain), which 
is the pagan origin of Halloween, and Dia de los Muertos, The Day of the Dead.  Come by 355 
during lunch on Thursday, open your mind, and explore your world. (Marino 10/5-6) 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

2022-23 Announcers  



 
COLLEGE AND CAREER 

 
Are you interested in giving back to your community at a fun event? Consider joining the Central 
Coast AirFest volunteer team! Volunteers are needed Saturday, October 15th or Sunday, October 
16th from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. Volunteers will get a free t-shirt, free lunch, and community service 
hours! Applications are due by this Friday! 
For more information, please see Ms. Teixeira in the College & Career Center.  (Teixeira 10/5-7 
 
Attention college-bound juniors: Don't forget to sign up for the PSAT! This is a great 
opportunity to practice for the SAT college entrance exam AND to be entered to earn a National 
Merit Scholarship. The cost is eighteen dollars. Space is limited so be sure to sign up by Friday! 
(Avrit 10/4-6) 
 
 

TECHNOLOGY INFO 

 
SPORTS NEWS 
 
WEEK IN SPORTS 
 

 

Team                 Start 

Var Girls Tennis @ Alan Hancock College     3:00 

Var Girls Golf vs. Santa Maria HS (Sr. Day)     3:00 

Freshman Football vs. Templeton HS      5:00 

        “Good luck to all our Teams” 

 
OTHER 
 

 
Seniors continue selling your donuts ALL money and forms must be returned to the Business 
Office on or before FRIDAY 10/7. NO exceptions. (Sylvester 10/6)  
 
Do you need a bike? The Santa Maria police department is donating three bikes. Bikes are based 
on need so please pick up an application from Melani in the career center. The application is very 
short and only requires you to write 1-2 paragraphs about why you deserve it! Pick up your 
application today and Best of luck to everyone. (Herrera 10/6-7) 
 


