
HCSD 

ITEM #
DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL UNIT QTY AWARDED TO: UNIT COST UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE 

11251235
BAG, PAPER, FLAT BOTTOM, 6" X 

11", PACK/100, 6#, WHITE

PACON 72020 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
PACK 10 PYRAMID $20.29 NO BID No Bid NO BID DNMS No Bid $13.95 NO BID $26.00

11501250

BATTERY, AA, 1.5 VOLT, PACK/4 

BATTERIES

EVERREADY EVE-EN91 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

PACK 300 PYRAMID $6.09 NO BID $3.44 $15.42 $2.85 No Bid $1.49 $2.25 $11.86

15012245

BINDER, 3-RING, 1.5" CLEARVIEW, 

INSERT YOUR OWN COVER, WHITE 

SOLD BY DOZEN

SAMSILL 18557 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
DZ 10 PYRAMID NO SAMPLE NO BID DNMS $43.14 NO SAMPLE No Bid $26.28 NO SAMPLE $54.00

13111335 BOOKENDS, 5", STEEL, BLACK
CLI 87510 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
PAIR 10

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
NO SAMPLE NO BID $2.92 $12.29 $3.49 $1.39 $2.09 $2.22 $13.50

16707670
CHART TABLET, 24" X 32", RULED, 1-

1/2", W/BROKEN LINE, WHITE

APC APS2415 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
EACH 50

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
$9.51 NO BID No Bid $14.50 $4.69 $3.27 $4.69 $3.72 NO BID

16606215
CORE, REPLACEMENT, 1", FOR TAPE 

DISPENSER

3M 946343 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 STAPLES $0.80 NO BID $0.37 $1.08 $0.45 No Bid NO BID $3.78 $4.50

10500105

CRAYONS, CLASSIC JUMBO, 8 

COLORS PER BOX/12 BOXES PER 

CARTON  

CRAYOLA 52-0080 (ONLY) CTN 10 STAPLES 3.3/$39.60 $10.80 $7.70 3.34/$40.08 $18.84 No Bid $8.28 $18.86 $63.22

10500120

CRAYONS, CLASSIC STANDARD, 8 

COLORS PER BOX/12 BOXES PER 

CARTON  

CRAYOLA 52-0008 (ONLY) CTN 10 STAPLES 0.69/$8.28 $5.80 $3.39 1.32/$15.84 $7.80 No Bid $3.60 $7.49 $33.50

10500180
CRAYONS, REFILL, STANDARD, 

BOX/12, YELLOW  

CRAYOLA 52-0836-034 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

BOX 10 STAPLES $1.79 $1.00 $0.55 $3.79 $1.39 $0.68 $0.59 $1.56 $8.20

16606230
DISPENSER, TAPE, HEAVY, 

WEIGHTED, 3" CORE

CLI 81300 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 STAPLES $2.57 NO BID $1.68 $7.27 $1.83 No Bid $4.19 $4.82 NO BID

15502645
ENVELOPE, BROWN KRAFT, 

W/CLASP, 9.5" X 12.5", BOX/100

QUALITY PARK 37893 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
BOX 50 HITOUCH $35.79 NO BID $12.24 $67.33 $8.97 No Bid $16.59 $14.04 $27.50

15252430
FILE FOLDER, LETTER, 1/3 CUT, 

MANILA, BOX/100

OXFORD 370-1/3 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
BOX 50

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
$20.33 NO BID $5.07 $14.12 $5.85 $4.91 $6.69 $7.03 $45.00

16906715 FLAG, OUTDOOR, GEORGIA, 4'X6'
VAL FORGE 46232700 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 PYRAMID $75.38 NO BID No Bid NO BID NO BID $53.26 $48.95 NO BID $61.00

16103001 HOLE PUNCH, 1/4", SINGLE HOLE
STANDARDS G-1 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 30 STAPLES $1.79 $0.72 $0.65 $4.38 $0.86 $0.67 $0.79 $0.89 NO BID

16103004

HOLE PUNCH, ADJUSTABLE, 3-

HOLE, 10 PAGE CAPACITY, WITH 

WASTE CONTAINER

OIC 90095 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 STAPLES $6.98 $3.88 $3.09 $42.21 $3.80 $3.70 $4.49 $6.67 $15.89

16203185
MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER, TANK 

STYLE,  GREEN  

SANFORD 25026 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
DZ 10

NATIONAL 

ART
$10.74 $3.90 $5.95 $10.41 NO SAMPLE NO SAMPLE $4.32 $5.78 $14.35

16203255
MARKER, PERMANENT, CHISEL TIP, 

8 COLORS, SET/8  

SHARPIE 38250 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
SET 10 HITOUCH $11.95 DNMS $5.86 $15.89 $4.86 $6.82 $5.69 $5.74 $10.59

16203250
MARKER, PERMANENT, FINE POINT, 

BLACK 

SANFORD SHARPIE 30001 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

DZ 50 PYRAMID $13.51 DNMS $8.28 $11.62 NO SAMPLE $10.15 $6.69 $8.30 $13.98

16203280

MARKER, TRANSPARENCY, WET 

ERASE, WIPE OFF, FINE POINT, VIS-

A-VIS, BLACK

VIS A VIS 16001 (ONLY) DZ 30 PYRAMID $19.65 $10.20 $10.53 $33.77 $8.69 No Bid $8.19 $11.18 $19.10

16505010

NOTEBOOK, SPIRAL, COLLEGE 

RULED, 70 SHEETS, ASSORTED 

COLOR COVERS

TOPS 65022 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
DZ 10

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
$2.57 $10.80 $5.48 $3.76 $6.58 $1.91 $17.52 $8.77 NO BID

16505025 PAD, "POST IT", 1.5" X 2", YELLOW
3M 653YW (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
DZ 50

NATIONAL 

ART
$2.80 $1.25 $5.05 $7.60 $1.50 $6.05 $1.25 $5.16 $15.71

10500430
PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 

OUNCE, RED

CRAYOLA 54-3115-38 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 STAPLES $5.34 $2.20 $1.60 $5.40 $2.75 $1.84 $1.95 $2.99 $8.82

10500550 PAINT, WASHABLE LIQUID, WHITE
CRAYOLA 54-2128-53 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
GAL 10 PYRAMID $29.69 $15.80 $13.00 DNMS DNMS $14.96 $12.95 $18.21 $24.02

10500640
PAINT, WATERCOLOR, OVAL, SET/8, 

ASSORTED

CRAYOLA 53-0080 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
SET 200 PYRAMID $6.66 $2.79 $1.65 $5.80 $3.15 $1.91 $1.59 $2.98 $11.09

16606005

PAPER CLIP, BINDER CLIP, LARGE 

2", 1" CAPACITY, PLASTIC CLIP 

W/HANDLES, BOX/12

ACCO 7072100B (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
BOX 40 STAPLES $2.89 $1.47 $1.05 $9.30 $1.15 $1.10 $1.49 $1.37 $12.98

16606010

PAPER CLIP, BINDER CLIP, MEDIUM 

1 1/4", 5/8" CAPACITY, PLASTIC 

CLIP W/HANDLES, BOX/12

ACCO 72050 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
BOX 50 STAPLES $3.11 $0.57 $0.35 $3.53 $0.39 $0.42 $0.59 $0.85 $29.80

16606015

PAPER CLIP, BINDER CLIP, SMALL 

3/4", 3/8" CAPACITY, PLASTIC CLIP 

W/HANDLES, BOX/12

GENERAL BC20 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
BOX 100 STAPLES $1.61 $0.28 $0.14 $1.82 $0.19 $0.18 $0.29 $0.61 NO BID

16707295
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18", 

80#, PACK/50, YELLOW

PACON TRU-RAY P103036 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

PACK 10 HITOUCH $7.66 NO BID $3.27 $9.39 $1.55 $3.74 $3.89 $4.50 $15.68

16707300
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 18" X 24", 

80#, PACK/50, ASSORTED

PACON TRU-RAY 103095 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

PACK 10 PYRAMID $16.11 NO BID $8.28 $19.55 DNMS $9.50 $7.95 NO BID $20.59

16707395
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", 

80#, PACK/50, YELLOW

PACON TRU-RAY P103004 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

PACK 10 STAPLES $3.77 NO BID $1.68 $4.42 DNMS $1.89 $2.29 $2.28 $10.49

16707410 PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", BLUE
AE COLOR 4771050 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
REAM 50 HITOUCH $11.33 NO BID $6.13 $26.34 $5.85 No Bid NO BID $6.90 NO BID

16707415

PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", BRIGHT 

RED BRIGHT RED/FESTIVE/HOLIDAY 

RED

ASTRO 45274 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
REAM 40 STAPLES $22.10 NO BID $7.75 $29.66 $7.99 No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID

BID RESPONSE AWARD 

WORKSHEET 
 BID# 25-025

 DUE: FEBRUARY 27, 2025 @ 2:00PM

Vendor: SIAK 

ENTERPRISE 

LLC

Vendor: 

NATIONAL 

ART Vendor: VIRTUE

 Awarded To:  Multiple Vendors

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/3.99%

PCARD 

(Fee): NO

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

Vendor: 

STAPLES

Vendor: 

PERIMETER Vendor: HiTOUCH

Vendor: SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY Vendor: PYRAMID Vendor: CASCADE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

Expiration: 

Expiration: 

12 MONTHS

Expiration: 6 

MONTHS Expiration: Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 12 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS
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BID RESPONSE AWARD 

WORKSHEET 
 BID# 25-025

 DUE: FEBRUARY 27, 2025 @ 2:00PM

Vendor: SIAK 

ENTERPRISE 

LLC

Vendor: 

NATIONAL 

ART Vendor: VIRTUE

 Awarded To:  Multiple Vendors

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/3.99%

PCARD 

(Fee): NO

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

Vendor: 

STAPLES

Vendor: 

PERIMETER Vendor: HiTOUCH

Vendor: SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY Vendor: PYRAMID Vendor: CASCADE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

Expiration: 

Expiration: 

12 MONTHS

Expiration: 6 

MONTHS Expiration: Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS Expiration: 12 MONTHS Expiration: 6 MONTHS

16707475
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", PINK AE COLOR 4763050 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
REAM 20 HITOUCH $11.59 NO BID $6.13 $26.34 $5.85 No Bid NO BID $6.90 NO BID

16707550
PAPER, DRAWING, SULPHITE, 9" X1 

2", 60#, WHITE

APC 609W (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
REAM 10 STAPLES $23.40 NO BID $7.49 $21.61 $8.15 No Bid $11.19 $8.39 $47.97

16707620

PAPER, PICTURE STORY, TOP 

BLANK, 18" X 12", BOTTOM 7/8", 

RULED W/DOTTED MIDLINE

APC 76 (or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)
REAM 10

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY
$14.03 NO BID No Bid $11.47 $13.80 $7.96 $12.75 NO BID NO BID

10500185
PAYONS, WATERCOLOR CRAYONS, 

SET/8, ASSORTED

PRANG 34180 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
SET 10 SIAK $5.41 NO BID No Bid NO BID $9.53 $6.40 $6.79 $7.03 $14.00

16404010

PENCIL, COLORED, W/O ERASER, 

ASSORTED, PRE-SHARPENED, 

SET/12 

CRAYOLA 68-4012 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
SET 10 STAPLES $3.12 $1.30 $1.15 $3.48 NO SAMPLE $1.33 $1.19 $1.87 $21.98

16404015

PENCIL, COLORED, W/O ERASER, 

ASSORTED, PRE-SHARPENED, 

SET/24  

PRANG 22240 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
SET 50 PYRAMID $11.46 NO BID $2.30 $11.64 $2.73 $3.81 $2.29 $3.23 $12.41

16606165
STAPLE REMOVER, METAL, 

W/PLASTIC HANDLE, SQUEEZE TYPE

CLI O5O (or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)
EACH 10 HITOUCH $0.50 NO BID $0.42 $1.95 $0.29 $1.43 $0.36 $0.68 NO BID

16606275
TAPE, SCOTCH MAGIC, 3/4" X 1" 

CORE

3M 6200 (or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)
ROLL 300 PYRAMID $1.48 $0.72 $1.10 $5.48 NO SAMPLE $1.05 $0.63 $2.74 $26.99

16606280
TAPE, SCOTCH MAGIC, 3/4" X 3" 

CORE

HIGHLAND 6200 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
ROLL 50 PYRAMID $5.32 $3.98 $2.39 $11.41 $6.53 No Bid $1.89 $4.70 $12.53

16606285
TAPE, TRANSPARENT (SHINY), 1" X 

3" CORE

3M 5910 (or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)
ROLL 50 SIAK $1.31 $6.44 No Bid $2.37 $5.58 No Bid $6.95 $6.72 $35.40

13111370
TRAY, FILE, PLASTIC, STACKABLE, 

LETTER SIZE, BLACK

OFFICEMATE 21002 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
EACH 10 STAPLES $5.29 NO BID $2.27 $32.27 $2.80 $2.57 $2.39 $2.46 $11.50


