Superintendent of Schools
Dr. Richard Rogers

BID RESPONSE AWARD

Board Members
W RK H E ET Helen Hughes, Chair Clyde Jackson, Jr.
Dr. Rick Unruh, Vice Chair Lori Johnson
Dave Crockett Jon Nichols
Mark Ivory
BID# 26-010
Vendor:
Vendor: Nationall] Vendor: Vendor: SCHOOL
DUE: JULY 31, 2025 @ 2:00PM Art Supplies PYRAMID PERIMETER SPECIALTY Vendor: QUILL
PCARD
PCARD (Fee): (Fee): PCARD (Fee): | PCARD (Fee): PCARD (Fee):
Awarded To: Multiple Vendors No yes/5% NO YES/NONE YES/NONE
Expiration: 12 | Expiration: 3] Expiration: 1 | Expiration: 6 Expiration: 6
MONTHS MONTHS MONTH MONTHS MONTHS
HCSD ITEM
4 DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL AWARDED TO: ~ UNIT COST  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
FM BRUSH 21449 (or equal, SCHOOL
1 215 |BRUSHES, WATERCOLOR, #4 1 NO BID . . . NO BID
0500215 |BRUSHES, COLOR, # send sample of other brands.) bz 0 SPECIALTY v $3.00 $3.99 $1.5 v
13111345 |FLAG, OUTDOOR, GEORGIA, 35 | VAL FORGE 35232700 (or equal, EACH 10 | PYRAMID | NOBID $35.95 $36.32 $36.76 NO BID
send sample of other brands.)
FOLDER, REPORT, W/FASTENERS,
15250530 |TWO POCKETS, 8.5° X 11", Box/25, | O ORD OXF 57715 (or equal, BOX 10 (IS NO BID $9.95 $5.60 $4.48 NO BID
send sample of other brands.) SPECIALTY
ASSORTED
MARKER, COLORING, CLASSIC, NATIONAL
16203110 FINELINE. SET/10, ASSORTED CRAYOLA 58-7726 (ONLY) SET 50 ART $1.65 $1.95 $2.39 $2.49 $2.10
MARKER, DRY ERASE, CHISEL TIP, NATIONAL
16203135 [FOR WHITEBOARDS, SET/4, 4- SANFORD 80074 ONLY SET 500 $2.52 $2.79 $3.75 $4.51 $2.93
ART
COLORS
MARKER, PERMANENT, FINE TIP,
16203278 ASSORTED. SET/12 SANFORD 30072 ONLY SET 10 PYRAMID $7.20 $6.69 $9.49 $9.98 $6.81




NOTEBOOK, SPIRAL, COLLEGE

16505010 |RULED, 70 SHEETS, ASSORTED TOPS 6|502f2 (tf]r eg“a" dse”d DZ 10 NAESFAL $9.60 $1095 | 1.99/23.88 $22.92 NO BID
COLOR COVERS Sample o1 other pran S.)
PAD, EASEL, SELF-STICK, PLAIN, 25" | POST-IT 102015 (or equal, send NATIONAL |
18505045 |,/ samole ofother brands EACH 10 i $21.80 $22.95 $36.34 No Bid NO BID
PACON TRU-RAY 103038 (or
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 12" X 18",
16606105 804, PACK/50. FESTIVE GREEN equal, send sample of other PACK 10 | PERIMETER NO BID $4.39 $3.70 $4.26 $4.84
brands.)
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", AE COLOR 4774050 (or equal, SCHOOL
16606115 15 NO BID NO BID 8.0 71 NO BID
GOLDENRQD send sample of other brands.) REAM SPECIALTY $ T
FAFLCN, UUTT, 0.0 A TT , NCLLT
GREEN ASTRO 22541 (or equal, send ,
16606265 |t ook samle of ofher brands REAM 10 | PERIMETER| NOBID NO BID $9.90 No Bid $10.93
16707205 |PEN. CORRECTION, WHITE BIC WSQP11(or equal, send EACH 50 (IR $1.58 $1.59 $2.15 $1.78 $1.61
sample of other brands.) ART
SCISSORS, PLASTIC HANDLE, ACME 13023/13403 (or equal,
18707430\ e ACHER/OFFICE, LIGHTWEIGHT, 8" | send sample of other brands.) EACH 100 U R LY DI NOBID
16707445 |SCISSORS, STAINLESS POINT, FISKARS 9458 (or equal, send DZ 10 | PERIMETER|  $2076 $32.28 $15.00 $39.96 NO BID
STUDENT, 7 sample of other brands.)
TAPE, PACKAGING. GENERAL 3M 3710-6 (or equal, send NATIONAL
18906711 |oyiomsE 16 MIL. 2* CLEAR sample of ofher brands ) ROLL 30 i $1.19 $1.39 $17.20 $8.68 NO BID




