BID ON: PAPER - AS NEEDED FROM OCTOBER 1, 2025 UNTIL DECEMBER 31, 2025

BID NO: 25-49
OPENED: AUGUST 20, 2025 @ 2:00 PM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
PAPER

Bond Paper (Graphic Arts Department)
1 20#,8-1/2"x 11", White

2 20#,8-12"x 11", Pastels

3 20#,8-1/2"x 11", Bright Colors

4 20# 8-1/2" x 14", White

5 20#, 8-1/2" x 14", Pastels

6  20#,8-1/2" x 14", Bright Colors

BIDDER

Southeast Office
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Office Solutions

Southeast Office
Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Strickland
Southeast Office
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Staples
Southeast Office
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Staples
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received

CARTON
PACK

5000
M
5000
10 (5000)
5000

5000
M
10 (5000)
5000

SM

5(2500)
5000
M
5000

10 (5000)
M
5000

COST
PER CTN

$35.90
$36.24
$36.70
$37.14
$38.15

$61.00
$62.00
$63.55
$72.60
NO BID

$126.70
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$27.79
$59.00
$60.15
$64.80
NO BID

$89.71

$93.45

$97.40
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

$3.67000
$3.71400

$6.10000
$6.20000
$6.35500
$7.26000

full carton

$5.55800

$6.48000

$8.97100
$9.35000
$9.74000

Page 1 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.007180
$0.007248
$0.007354
$0.007428
$0.007630

$0.012200
$0.012400
$0.012710
$0.014520

$0.025340

$0.011116
$0.011800
$0.012030
$0.012960

$0.017942
$0.018690
$0.019480

BRAND

Sylvamo
Daiei
Xerographic
Staples 324791
Veritiv

Performance
Sylvamo
Staples
Sylvamo

Neenah

Staples 24489558
Performance
Sylvamo
Performance

Hammermill
Sylvamo
Sylvamo

TRADE NAME

Sparco
Supreme
Sylvamo

Staples Copy Paper

Veritiv

Leading Edge
Hammermill
Staples Pastels
Hammermill

Astrobright

Staples Copy Paper
Leading Edge
Hammermill
Leading Edge

Hammermill Color
Hammermill
Hammermill

NUMBER OF
COLORS

10

24



ITEM DESCRIPTION

10

11

12

13

PAPER

20#, 11" x 17", White

20#, 11" X 17", Pastels

24#, 8-1/2" x 11", White

24#, 8-1/2" x 11", Pastels

24#, 8-1/2" x 11", Bright Colors

244#, 8-1/2" x 14", White

24#, 8-1/2" x 14", Pastels

BIDDER

Southeast Office
Strickland
Staples

Office Equip. Co.

Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples

Office Equip. Co.

Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Southeast Office

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office

Office Equip. Co.

Office Solutions

Staples

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples

Office Equip. Co.

Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples

Office Equip. Co.

Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

2500
2500
4(2000)
2500

2500

5000
5000
M
10 (5000)

SM

10 (5000)
5000
M

M
10 (5000)

SM

COST
PER CTN

$46.20
$47.30
$41.43
$52.00
NO BID

$73.50
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$56.00
$71.60
$78.25
$86.22
NO BID

$106.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$92.12
$158.00
$172.40
NO BID
NO BID

$85.40

$114.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$145.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

$10.35750
$5.20000

$14.70000

$7.16000

$8.62200

$10.64000

$9.21200
$15.80000
$17.24000

$11.44000

$14.50000

Page 2 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.018480
$0.018920
$0.020715
$0.020800

$0.029400

$0.011200
$0.014120
$0.015560
$0.017244

$0.021280

$0.018424
$0.031600
$0.034480

$0.021350
$0.022880

$0.029000

BRAND

Performance
Sylvamo
Staples 24489559
Performance

Sylvamo

Performance
Performance
Sylvamo

Hammermill 406231

Sylvamo

Neenah
Neenah
Neenah

Sylvamo

TRADE NAME

Leading Edge

Hammermill Copy
Staples Copy Paper

Leading Edge

Hammermill

Leading Edge
Leading Edge
Williamsburg

Hammermill Premium

Hammermill

Astrobright
Astrobright
Astrobright

Williamsburg

Hammermill 852498 Hammermill Premium

Sylvamo

Springhill

NUMBER OF
COLORS

21
18
24



ITEM DESCRIPTION

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

24#, 8-1/2" x 14", Bright Colors

24#, 11" x 17" White

24#, 11" x 17" Pastels

Bond Paper (Schools)
20#, 8-1/2" x 11", White

20#, 8-1/2" x 11", Pastels

20#, 8-1/2" x 11", Bright Colors

20#, 8-1 /2" x 14", White

No Bids Received

Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Southeast Office
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Office Solutions

Southeast Office
Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Strickland
Southeast Office
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Staples
Southeast Office
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

2500
5(2500)

2500

5000

M

5000
10 (5000)

5000
M
10 (5000)
5000

SM

5(2500)
5000
M
5000

COST
PER CTN

$83.88

$97.23
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$116.25
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$35.90
$36.24
$36.70
$37.14
NO BID

$61.00
$62.00
$63.55
$72.60
NO BID

$126.70
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$27.79
$59.00
$60.15
$64.80
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

$19.44600

$23.25000

$3.71400

$6.10000
$6.20000
$6.35500
$7.26000

full carton

$5.55800

Page 3 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.033600
$0.038892

$0.046500

$0.007180
$0.007248
$0.007354
$0.007428

$0.012200
$0.012400
$0.012710
$0.014520

$0.025340

$0.011116
$0.011800
$0.012030
$0.012960

BRAND

Sylvamo

TRADE NAME

NUMBER OF
COLORS

Williamsburg

Hammermill 755097 Hammermill Premium

Sylvamo

Sylvamo
Daiei
Sylvamo
Staples 324791

Performance
Sylvamo
Staples
Sylvamo

Neenah

Staples 24489558
Performance
Sylvamo
Performance

Hammermill

Sparco
Supreme
Xerographic

Staples Copy Paper

Leading Edge 5

Hammermill

Staples Pastels 10

Hammermill

Astrobright 24

Staples Copy Paper
Leading Edge

Hammermill

Leading Edge



ITEM DESCRIPTION

21 20#, 8-1/2" x 14", Pastels

22 20#, 8-1/2" x 14", Bright Colors

23 20#,11"x 17", White

24 20#,11" X 17", Pastels

25 24#,8-1/2" x 11", White

26 24# 8-1/2"x 11", Pastels

27 24#,8-1/2" x 11", Bright Colors

28 24#,8-1/2" x 14", White

Staples
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received

Southeast Office
Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Southeast Office
Office Equip. Co.
Strickland
Staples
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Strickland
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

10 (5000)
M
5000

2500
2500
4(2000)
2500

2500

5000

5000

M
10 (5000)

SM

10 (5000)
5000
M

M
10 (5000)

COST
PER CTN

$89.71

$93.45

$97.40
NO BID
NO BID

$46.20
$47.30
$41.43
$52.00
NO BID

$73.50
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$56.00
$71.60
$78.25
$86.22
NO BID

$106.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$92.12
$158.00
$172.40
NO BID
NO BID

$85.40
$114.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

$8.97100
$9.35000
$9.74000

$10.35750

$14.70000

$8.62200

$10.64000

$9.21200
$15.80000
$17.24000

$11.44000

Page 4 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.017942
$0.018690
$0.019480

$0.018480
$0.018920
$0.020715
$0.020800

$0.029400

$0.011200
$0.014120
$0.011560
$0.017244

$0.021228

$0.018424
$0.031600
$0.034480

$0.021350
$0.022880

BRAND

Hammermill
Sylvamo
Sylvamo

Performance
Sylvamo

Staples 24489559

Performance

Sylvamo

Performance
Performance
Sylvamo

Hammermill 1015572 Hammermill Premium

Sylvamo

Neenah
Neenah
Neenah

Sylvamo

Hammermill 852498 Hammermill Premium

TRADE NAME

Hammermill Color
Hammermill
Hammermill

Leading Edge
Hammermill Copy

Staples Copy Paper

Leading Edge

Hammermill

Leading Edge
Leading Edge
Williamsburg

Hammermill

Astrobright
Astrobright
Astrobright

Williamsburg

NUMBER OF
COLORS

21
18
24



ITEM DESCRIPTION

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

24#, 8-1/2" x 14", Pastels

24#, 8-1/2" x 14", Bright Colors

24#, 11" x 17", White

24# 11" X 17", Pastels

20#, 8-1/2" x 11", Bond Paper- 3 hole

punched

Offset or Bond Paper
20#, 17" x 22", White

20#, 17" x 22", Colors
20#, 17-1/2" x 22-1/2", White
20#, 17-1/2" x 22-1/2", Colors

Index Paper
65#, 8-1/2" x 11", Bright Colors

CARTON
PACK

Strickland SM
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received

Strickland 2500
Staples 5(2500)
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland 2500
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland SM
Staples 5(2500)
Office Equip. Co. 5000
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received
No Bids Received
No Bids Received
No Bids Received
Staples 8 (2000)
Office Equip. Co. 2000
Strickland M

Southeast Office
Office Solutions

COST
PER CTN

$145.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$83.88

$97.23
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$116.25
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$48.45

$28.29

$55.90
NO BID
NO BID

$82.95
$134.00
$136.54
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

$14.50000

$19.44600

$23.25000

$5.65800

$10.36875
$16.75000
$17.07000

Page 5 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.029000

$0.033600
$0.038892

$0.046500

$0.009690
$0.011316
$0.011180

$0.041475
$0.067000
$0.068200

BRAND

Sylvamo

Sylvamo

TRADE NAME

Springhill

Williamsburg

Hammermill 755097 Hammermill Premium

Sylvamo

Sylvamo
Staples 24489557
Performance

Neenah
Neenah
Neenah

Hammermill

Hammermill

Staples Copy Paper

Leading Edge

Astrobright
Astrobright
Astrobright

NUMBER OF
COLORS

20
18
26



ITEM DESCRIPTION

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

49

90#, 8-1/2" x 11", White

90#, 8-1/2" x 11", Pastels

90#, 22-1/2" x 35", White
90#, 22-1/2" x 35", Colors
90#, 24" x 36", Ivory only

90#, 11" x 17", White

110#, 8-12" x 11", White

110#, 8-12" x 11", Pastels

1104, 22-1/2" x 35", White
110#, 22-1/2" x 35", Colors

110#, 24" x 36", Ivory only

Southeast Office
Staples
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Strickland
Staples
Office Equip. Co.
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received
No Bids Received
No Bids Received

Office Equip. Co.
Strickland
Southeast Office
Staples
Office Solutions

Staples
Southeast Office
Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Office Solutions

Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions
No Bids Received
No Bids Received

No Bids Received

CARTON
PACK

2000
8 (2000)
M
2000

2M

1000
M

8 (2000)
2000
M
2000

2M

COST

PER CTN

$69.00
$70.35
$77.00
$90.10
NO BID

$87.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$84.50

$88.85
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$69.20
$89.00
$100.52
$104.50
NO BID

$106.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST

PER REAM

$8.79375

$10.93000

$8.65000

$13.36000

Page 6 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.034500
$0.035175
$0.038500
$0.045050

$0.043700

$0.084500
$0.088850

$0.034600
$0.044500
$0.050260
$0.052250

$0.053450

BRAND

Performance
Neenah 567662
Neenah
Sylvamo

Neenah

Sylvamo
Neenah

Staples 490887
Performance
Neenah
Neenah

Neenah

TRADE NAME

Leading Edge
Neenah Paper
Exact
Springhill

Exact

Springhill
Exact

Staples Cardstock
Leading Edge
Exact
Exact

Exact

NUMBER OF
COLORS



ITEM DESCRIPTION

50

51

52

53

54

55

NCR Black Print, 20# - Copy Machines
8-1/2"x 11", 2 part

8-1/2"x 11", 3 part

8-1/2"x 11", 4 part

8-1/2"x 11", 5 part

NCR Black Print, 20# - Copy Machines
8-1/2" x 14", 2 part

8-1/2" x 14", 3 part

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

5000
M
10 (5000)

5000
M
10 (5000)

5000
SM

SM

SM

SM

COST
PER CTN

$228.00
$248.45
$256.11
NO BID
NO BID

$258.00
$277.45
$283.73
NO BID
NO BID

$277.00
$296.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$305.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$317.25
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$357.30
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST

PER REAM

$25.61100

$28.37300

Page 7 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.045600
$0.049690
$0.051222

$0.051200
$0.055490
$0.056633

$0.055400
$0.059380

$0.061080

$0.063450

$0.071460

BRAND TRADE NAME NUMBER OF
COLORS
Xerox Vitality
Nekoosa NCR
NCR Paper 40686 NCR Paper Superior
Xerox Vitality
Nekoosa NCR

Appleton NCR 40684 Appleton NCR Superior

Xerox Vitality
Nekoosa NCR
Nekoosa NCR
Nekoosa NCR
Nekoosa NCR



ITEM DESCRIPTION

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

8-1/2" x 14", 4 part

8-1/2" x 14", 5 part

NCR Black Print, 20# - Copy Machines
11x 17", 2 part

11 x 17", 3 part

11 x 17", 4 part

11 x 17", 5 part

NCR Black Print, 20# - Presses
8-1/2"x 11", 2 part

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

SM

SM

2500

2500

2500

2500

5000
SM

COST
PER CTN

$382.50
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$392.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$252.60
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$279.15
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$299.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$306.65
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$228.00
$248.45
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

Page 8 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.076500

$0.078580

$0.101040

$0.111660

$0.119600

$0.122660

$0.045600
$0.049690

BRAND

Nekoosa

Nekoosa

Nekoosa

Nekoosa

Nekoosa

Nekoosa

Xerox
Nekoosa

TRADE NAME

NCR

NCR

NCR

NCR

NCR

NCR

Vitality
NCR

NUMBER OF
COLORS



ITEM DESCRIPTION

63

64

65

66

67

68

8-1/2"x 11", 3 part

8-12"x 11", 4 part

8-172"x 11", 5 part

Computer Paper
20 Ib.
9-1/2" x 11" Blank

14-7/8" x 8-1/2" Blank

14-7/8" x 8-1/2" - 1/2" Green Bar

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland

Office Equip. Co.

Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.

Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON
PACK

5000
SM

5000
SM

SM

2700
2500

2700
2700

2700

COST
PER CTN

$258.00
$277.45
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$277.00
$296.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$305.40
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$68.33

$66.20
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$86.80
$104.30
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$86.80
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

25.3074/M; .025307

32.1481/M; .032148

32.1481/M; .032148

Page 9 of 11

COST

PER SHT.

$0.051200
$0.055490

$0.055400
$0.059380

$0.061080

$0.026480

$0.038600

BRAND

Xerox
Nekoosa

Xerox
Nekoosa

Nekoosa

TST
TST

TST
TST

TST

TRADE NAME

Vitality
NCR

Vitality
NCR

NCR

Alliance
59071

Alliance
49077

Alliance

NUMBER OF
COLORS



ITEM DESCRIPTION

69

70

71

72

73

74

75

76

14-7/8" x 11" Blank

14-7/8" x 11" -

1/2" Green Bar

14-7/8" x 11 - 1/2" Blue Bar

NCR Computer Paper
9-12"x 11" - 2 Part

9-1/2"x 11" - 3 Part

9-1/2"x 11" - 4 Part

Offset Paper, 70#, 17-1/2" x 22-1/2"
White

Colors

Office Equip. Co.
Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Office Equip. Co.
Strickland
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

CARTON
PACK

2700

2700
2700

2700

1700
1700

1200
1200

900
900

COST
PER CTN

$98.80
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$80.25

$94.80
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$94.80
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$85.10
$108.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$92.85
$104.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$95.50
$126.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER REAM

36.5925/M; .036592

35.1111/M; .035111

35.1111/M;.035111

Page 10 of 11

COST
PER SHT.

$0.022970

$0.050000
$0.063529

$0.077400
$0.086660

$0.106100
$0.014000

BRAND

TST

TST
TST

TST

TST
TST

TST
TST

TST
TST

TRADE NAME NUMBER OF

COLORS

Alliance

59093
Alliance

Alliance

49087
Alliance

59088
Alliance

79089
Alliance



ITEM DESCRIPTION

77

78

79

80

81

82

ITEM

83

84

85

Offset Paper, 70#, 23" x 35"
White

Colors

Offset Paper, 60#, 17-1/2" x 22-1/2"
White

Colors

Cover Stock Paper
65#, 23" x 35" Bright Colors

80#, 11" x 17" Glossy White Cardstock

DESCRIPTION

Oversize Poster/Banner Paper and Vinyl
54" x 165' Solvent glossy paper, 3" core,
8 mil gloss

38" x 164' Solvent glossy paper, 3" core,
8 mil gloss

38" x 164' Solvent glossy vinyl, 3" core

CARTON
PACK
No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

Strickland 500
Office Equip. Co.
Staples
Southeast Office
Office Solutions

Strickland 750
Office Equip. Co.
Staples

Southeast Office
Office Solutions

CARTON

PACK

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

COST
PER CTN

$293.74
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$79.50
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

COST
PER CTN

COST
PER REAM

COST
PER REAM

COST
PER SHT.

$0.106000

COST
PER SHT.

BRAND

Neenah

Condat

BRAND

ALL BIDDERS ARE TO SUBMIT THE COLORS AND COLOR NUMBERS AVAILABLE FOR EACH BID ITEM THAT IS LISTED AS

BRIGHT OR PASTEL COLORS

TERMS OF PAYMENT: 30 DAYS

METHOD OF AWARD: Individual item basis.

ALL PAPER MUST BE PACKAGED AND SHIPPED IN STURDY BOXES AND REAMS MUST NOT BE BROKEN INSIDE OF THE BOXES.

THIS IS TO AVOID EXCESSIVE MOISTURE BUILD UP AND JAMMED COPY MACHINES.

REPEATED DELIVERY OF DEFECTIVE ITEMS COULD BE REASON FOR REJECTION QJTQEIH of 11

TRADE NAME

Astrobright

38044

TRADE NAME

NUMBER OF
COLORS

17

NUMBER OF
COLORS



	Paper, Envelopes, File Folders

