BID ON: LAWN EQUIPMENT - AS NEEDED BASIS
BID NO: 25-39
OPENED: JULY 30, 2025 @ 2:30 PM

DESCRIPTION BIDDER UNIT COST CHAIN BRAND/MODEL DELIVERY ARO
Gas Trimmer, displacement 41.6 cc, power 2.7 bhp, cutting width 16.5", JBT Power $537.19 Stihl / FS251R 5 Days or Sooner
weight 14.6lbs, fuel capacity 25.4 oz, anti-vibration Autrey Greer & Sons $537.19 Stihl / FS251R 7-10 Days
Brand: Stihl Wilson Dismukes $537.19 FS251R 7-10 Business Days
Model: FS251R or approved equal Capital Tractor $669.99 Stihl / FS251R 30 Days
Edger, 28.4 cc, 1.73 cu. in. displacement, 1.27 bhp, JBT Power $339.69 Stihl / FC91 5 Days or Sooner
Blade Size 8.0" Autrey Greer & Sons $339.69 Stihl / FC91 7-10 Days
Brand: Stihl Wilson Dismukes $339.69 FCI1 7-10 Business Days
Model: FC 91 or approved equal Capital Tractor $419.99 Stihl / FC91 30 Days
Hedge Trimmer, 27.2 cc, 1.66 cu. in. displacement, 1.01 bhp, JBT Power $276.49 Stihl / HS45 5 Days or Sooner
Cutting Bar Length 18" Autrey Greer & Sons $276.49 Stihl / HS45 7-10 Days
Brand: Stihl Wilson Dismukes $276.49 HS45 18 7-10 Business Days
Model: HS 45 or approved equal Capital Tractor $339.99 Stihl / HS45 18 30 Days
Blower, 63.3 cc, 3.86 cu. in. displacement, 2.9 kw engine power, JBT Power $363.39 Stihl / BR430 5 Days or Sooner
Air Flow Rate 500 cfm, Air Velocity 183 mph Autrey Greer & Sons $363.39 Stihl / BR430 7-10 Days
Brand: Stihl Wilson Dismukes $363.39 BR430 7-10 Business Days
Model: BR 430 or approved equal Capital Tractor $449.99 Stihl / BR430 30 Days
Chainsaw, 35.2 cc, (2.15 cu. in.) displacement, 1.8 kW (2.41 bhp) JBT Power $709.79 12" Stihl / MS201T C-M 5 Days or Sooner
engine power, 12-16 inch bar length Autrey Greer & Sons $718.89 Stihl / MS201T CM 7-10 Days
Brand: Stihl Wilson Dismukes $718.89 201TCM12 7-10 Business Days
Model: MS 201T C-M or approved equal Capital Tractor $899.99 Stihl / MS201T C-M 12 30 Days
JBT Power $717.59 14" Stihl / MS201T CM 5 Days or Sooner
Autrey Greer & Sons $726.79 Stihl / MS201T CM 7-10 Days
Wilson Dismukes $726.79 201TCM14 7-10 Business Days
Capital Tractor $909.99 Stihl / MS201T C-M 14 30 Days
JBT Power $725.39 16" Stihl / MS201T CM 5 Days or Sooner
Autrey Greer & Sons $734.69 Stihl / MS201T CM 7-10 Days
Wilson Dismukes $734.69 201TCM16 7-10 Business Days
Capital Tractor $919.99 Stihl / MS201T C-M 16 30 Days



ITEM

10

DESCRIPTION

Chain Saw, 45.6 cc, (2.78 cu. in.) displacement, 2.2 kW (3.0 bhp)
18 inch bar length and pitc .325 inch

Brand: Stihl

Model: MS251 or approved equal

Chain Saw, 55.5 cc (3.39 cu. in.) displacement, 2.8 kW (3.76 bhp)
engine power, 16-20 inch bar length

Brand: Stihl

Model: MS 291 or approved equal

Chain Saw, 64.1 cc (3.9 cu. in.) displacement, 3.3 kW (4.4 bhp)
engine power, 16-20 inch bar length

Brand: Stihl

Model: MS 391 or approved equal

Push Mower, 21" cut, steel deck with deck wash, dual-lever height adj.,
173 cc engine, recoil start, FWD with single lever drive control,

11" rear wheels, 1.9 bushel dust blocking grass bag

Brand: Cub Cadet

Model: 12AVB2KM?710 or approved equal

Pole Pruner, telescoping, displacement 36.3 cc (2.2 cu. in.),
engine power 1.4kW (1.9 bhp), shaft length 8'10" to 12'10",
fuel capacity 17.90z, oil capacity 7.40z, weight 17.4lbs
Brand: Stihl

Model: HT135 or approved equal

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor
JBT Power

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
JBT Power
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Capital Tractor
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

UNIT COST

$339.69
$339.69
$339.69
$419.99

$505.59
$505.59
$505.59
$629.99

$513.49
$513.49
$513.49
$639.99

$600.39
$600.39
$749.99
No Bid

$608.29
$608.29
$608.29
$759.99

$616.19
$616.19
$620.14
$769.99

$360.00
$1,059.99
NO BID

NO BID

$631.99
$631.99
$631.99
$789.99

CHAIN

18"

20"

16"

18"

20"

BRAND/MODEL

Stihl / MS251
Stihl / MS251
MS251

Stihl / MS251 Wood Boss

Stihl / MS291
Stihl / MS291
MS291 18
Stihl / MS291 18

Stihl / MS291
Stihl / MS291
MS291 20
MS291 20

Stihl / MS391
MS391 16
Stihl / MS391-16

Stihl / MS391
Stihl / MS391
MS391 18
Stihl / MS391-18

Stihl / MS391
MS391 20
Stihl / MS391
Stihl/ MS391-20

TORO /21321
Stihl / RM655V

Stihl / HT135
Stihl / HT135
HT135 14
Stihl / HT135-14

DELIVERY ARO

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
5 Days or Sooner
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days



ITEM

11

12

13

14

15

DESCRIPTION

Riding Mower, 20 HP engine, 2 cylinder, gasoline
42" deck, bagger.

Brand: Husqvarna

Model: YTH20K42 or approved equal

Commercial Edger, 127 cc 4 cycle Briggs & Stratton engine,
4 wheel model with 8 inch heavy duty wheels.

10" steel blade.

Brand: Little Wonder

Model: 6033-00-01 or approved equal

Zero Turn Riding Mower, 60" UltraCut Series 6 Deck with heavy-duty
spindle. Two Parker unitized pump and wheel motor systems with no
hoses, 16¢cc pumps and 17.1 cubic inch motors. 25.5 hp Kawasaki. Adapt
technology to adjust deck rake quickly and easily. 16cc drive system.
Brand: Exmark Lazer Z X Series

Model: LRX801GKA606Q1 or approved equal

Commercial Midmount Mower, 72" Side Discharge Cutting Deck,
3-Cylinder 37.4 HP Diesel Engine, Liquid Cooled, 11.5 Gal Fuel Tank
capacity, Zero Turn Radius, Caliper Disc Brakes, Forward

Speed 0-11.5 mph, Reverse 0-5 mph. Foldable ROPS

Brand: John Deere

Model: Z997R or approved equal

Compact Tractor, 4WD, Vertical Liquid-Cooled 4 cycle diesel
Gear Drive Transmission, 47.3 HP Engine, 4 cylinders, 13.5 Gal.
Fuel Tank capacity, Sliding Gear and Constant Mesh 8 Forward
& 8 Reverse Transmission, Wet Disc Brakes, Forward Speed
1.4-14.9 mph, Reverse 1.3-14.3 mph, Foldable ROPS, Turf Tires
Brand: Kubota

Model: L4701 or approved equal

Capital Tractor
JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes

JBT Power
Capital Tractor
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes

Capital Tractor
JBT Power
JBT Power - Alternate
Wilson Dismukes
Autrey Greer & Sons

Capital Tractor
JBT Power
Wilson Dismukes
Autrey Greer & Sons

Capital Tractor
JBT Power
Wilson Dismukes
Autrey Greer & Sons

UNIT COST

$6,496.32
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$800.00
$1,663.00
NO BID

NO BID

$10,879.72
$13,000.00
$12,000.00
$13,600.00
NO BID

$22,423.72

$25,500.00
NO BID
NO BID

$25,384.32

$25,400.00
NO BID
NO BID

CHAIN BRAND/MODEL

Kubota / T2290KWTNC-48

McLane / 100-5.5 OGT-7
Little Wonder / 6033-00-01

Kubota / Z726 XKWNC-60
Exmark / LRX801GKA606Q1
TORO /72910
LRX601GKA606Q1

Kubota / ZD1611LF-72
TORO /72076

Kubota / L4802DT
KIOTI/ DK5020MB

DELIVERY ARO

30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
30 Days

30 Days
5 Days or Sooner
5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Business Days

30 Days
5 Days or Sooner

30 Days
5 Days or Sooner



ITEM

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DESCRIPTION
Items #16 thru #22 to be awarded as a lump sum.

Power Source
Brand: Stihl
Model: KM131R or approved equal

Standard Trimmer Head (attachment for the Stihl KM131R)
Model: FS-KM or approved equal

Edger, 8-inch blade (attachment for the Stihl KM131R)
Model: FCB-KM or approved equal

Tiller/Cultivator, 6-5" inch tilling swath (attachment for the Stihl KM131R)
Model: BF-KM or approved equal

Hedge Clipper, 20-inch double-sided, (attachment for Stihl KM131R)
double-reciprocating blades and extra heavy-duty

commercial-grade gear box

Model: HL-KM or approved equal

Adjustable Hedge Trimmer (attachment for Stihl KM131R)
Model: Stihl HL-KM 145° or approved equal

Pole Pruner (attachment for Stihl KM131R)
Model: HT-KM or approved equal

Total of items #16 thru #22

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Autrey Greer & Sons
JBT Power
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Autrey Greer & Sons
JBT Power
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Wilson Dismukes
Autrey Greer & Sons
JBT Power
Capital Tractor

JBT Power
Autrey Greer & Sons
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

Autrey Greer & Sons
JBT Power
Wilson Dismukes
Capital Tractor

UNIT COST

$426.59
$426.59
$426.59
$529.99

$108.22
$110.00
$116.99
$126.99

$90.00
$100.55
$107.99
$117.99

$200.00
$202.82
$227.99
$237.99

$195.15
$200.00
$218.99
$228.99

$220.99
$282.09

$300.00
$330.99

$220.00
$220.73
$248.99
$258.99

$1,536.15
$1,546.59
$1,568.53
$1,831.93

BRAND/MODEL

Stihl
Stihl / KM131R
KMI131R
Stihl / KM131R

Stihl / FS-KM
Stihl
FS-KM
Stihl /41802000471

Stihl
Stihl / FCB-KM
FCB-KM
Stihl / 41807405003

Stihl
Stihl / BF-KM
BF-KM
Stihl /46017405001

Stihl / HL-KM
Stihl
HL-KM
Stihl / 42437405001

HL-KM 145
Stihl / HL-KM 145
Stihl
20" Stihl / 42437405004

12" Stihl
Stihl / HT-KM
HT-KM
Stihl / 41822000210

If bidding a brand and model other than specified, bidder shall include a copy of the warranty. All brands and models quoted by

bidder must meet or exceed the warranty offered by each brand/model listed on the pricing sheet or could be rejected.

DELIVERY ARO

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

7-10 Days
5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

7-10 Days
5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Business Days
30 Days

7-10 Business Days
7-10 Days
5 Days or Sooner
30 Days

5 Days or Sooner
7-10 Days
7-10 Business Days
30 Days



	Fax Machines

