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What is a FID Day

A FID Day is a Flexible Instructional Day where students will learn from home due to
inclement weather or an emergency where school is closed. Parents will be notified
through the district's calling system.

What is the Virtual Classroom?

Frazier’s Virtual Classrooms can be accessed through the teacher landing pages. It is
online learning taught by Frazier School District Teachers. Students will log into their
Google Classroom and follow their regular schedules as indicated in this document.
They will have the opportunity to engage in live, virtual instructional sessions with
teachers. Online learning sessions can include, but are not limited to group discussions,
activities, and projects.

When would students utilize the Virtual Classroom/ FID option?

Frazier students will be able to utilize the virtual classroom on Flexible Instruction Days
(snow/ cold weather) and emergency closures.



What are the schedules for the Frazier Virtual Classroom?

Elementary School

FID Day Schedule - Elementary School 2021/2022

Office Hours 8:30 - 9:00

Pd. 1 9:00-9:30

Pd.2 9:35 - 10:05

Pd. 3 10:10 - 10:40

Lunch 10:45-11:15

Pd. 4 11:20 - 11:50

Pd. 5 11:55 - 12:25

Pd. 6 12:30-1:00

Pd. 7 1:05-1:35

Office Hours 1:40 - 3:00

Middle School

FID Day Schedule - Middle School 2021/2022

Office Hours 8:30 -9:00

Period 1 9:00-9:40

Period 2 9:45-10:25

Period 3 10:30-11:10

Lunch 11:15-11:45

Period 5 11:50-12:30

Period 6 12:35-1:10

Band 1:15-2:00

Office Hours 1:15-3:00



High School

7:30-8:00 Office Hours

8:00 - 8:55 Period 1

9:00 - 9:55 Period 2

10:00 - 10:45 Office Hours

10:45 - 11:15 Lunch

11:15 - 12:00 Office Hours

12:00 - 12:55 Period 5

1:00 - 1:55 Period 6

2:00 - 3:00 Office Hours

Student Attendance/Expectations

Students are required to be present and visible via zoom or google meet during
the designated times as indicated on their respective schedules. If a student logs
in and is not visible (black screen) he or she will be considered absent during that class
period.

What if my child needs extra help?

Teachers will also conduct open office hours for students to seek assistance, receive
feedback, and/or additional instructional time to reinforce learning. Teachers, students,
parents, and guardians can request time to meet during office hours. Teachers will be
available for reinforcement upon request as well as Evening tutoring sessions may be
available upon request. Please contact your child’s teacher for more information.



What if my child does not have access to the internet?

Please contact your child’s building secretary at 724-736-9507.

What is the grading scale during Virtual Learning?

Frazier School District will utilize the regular grading scale. Please see each school’s
handbook for more information.

Frazier Elementary School Handbook

Frazier Middle School Handbook

Frazier High School Handbook

What is the plan for students that will attend CWCTC?

Students will attend their Frazier Classes on these days. If the CTC is cancelled as well
and offers a virtual option, students will be required to attend those classes virtually as
well.

What about my child’s IEP?

If any necessary changes are required to implement your child's IEP in a virtual format,
your child's case manager will contact you directly. Teachers and service providers will
be available to provide live, virtual services. If you have additional questions, please
contact Eric Johnson at 724-736-9507 x 128.

Does this plan pertain to students enrolled in the Pre-K Program?

Yes, students in the Pre-K Program will also participate in the Virtual Classroom when
school is closed due to inclement weather conditions or a designated Flexible
Instruction Day. The Pre-K Teacher will contact the families of Pre-K students to arrange
programming.

Where can I find more information?

Be sure to check the Frazier School District Website for the most up-to-date information
regarding the 2021-2022 school year.

Additional Education Resources can be located on the Frazier School District
Educational Resources Page.

https://docs.google.com/document/d/1qP6RMeRg64oE0YEUeSDIfVgipf4msY1yJjyYjNDdq2U/edit?usp=sharing
https://content.myconnectsuite.com/api/documents/adb0c061441b4bc6b499b4bba6676083.pdf
https://content.schoolinsites.com/api/documents/0b3b03d9ea2742c789df9e16928e3da5.pdf
https://www.frazierschooldistrict.org/returntoschool
https://www.frazierschooldistrict.org/educationalresources
https://www.frazierschooldistrict.org/educationalresources

