Sumter County Schools Special Called Meeting
07/27/2023 05:00 PM
Central Office

MEETING MINUTES

District Mission Statement: The mission of the Sumter County Public School System is to use all available
resources to provide all students with a challenging and quality education that will ultimately improve the quality
of their lives and allow students the greatest opportunity for success after graduation.

Attendees

Voting Members

Mrs. Beretha Washington, Board Member
Ms Sharon Nelson, Board Member

Mrs Jeanette Payne, Chairman

Ms Darla Spencer, Vice Chairman

Ms Eleanor James, Board Member

Mrs Lillian Wideman, Board Member
None Voting Members

Dr. Marcy Burroughs

Attorney E. Dianne Gamble

A. CALLTO ORDER
Meeting called to order by Board Chair Payne at 5:00 pm
B. INVOCATION/PLEDGE
C. ESTABLISHMENT OF QUORUM
Board President Payne called the roll and the following members were present/absent:
President Ms. Jeanette Brassfield-Payne
Vice President Ms. Darla Spencer
Mrs. Lillian Wideman

Ms. Eleanor James
Ms. Sharon Nelson

Absent Ms. Beretha Washington
Superintendent Dr. Marcy Burroughs
Attorney Absent Ms. Diane Gamble

1. DISTRICT MISSION STATEMENT
D. APPROVAL OF AGENDA
The Board President recommends adoption of a motion "to approve the agenda for July 27, 2023.

Motion made by: Mrs Lillian Wideman
Motion seconded by: Ms Eleanor James




Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - No

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Passed.
E. PRESENTATION

Representative A} McCampbell - Grant Money for Capital Improvement
F. NEW ACTION ITEMS
1. Approve Child Nutrition Programs Bids

The superintendent recommends adoption of a motion “to approve the Child Nutrition
Program bids as stipulated in Exhibit F1 herein.”

e Produce
e Cafeteria Tables

Motion made by: Ms Eleanor James
Motion seconded by: Ms Darla Spencer
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - Yes

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Passed.
G. PERSONNEL
1. Rescind Non-Renewal of Personnel

The Superintendent recommends the adoption of a motion to rescind non-renewal of
personnel as stipulated in Exhibit G1 herein. -

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION  EFFECTIVE DATE
Classified
Billy L Noble BELL/Custodian 05/27/2023

Motion made by: Ms Darla Spencer
Motion seconded by: Mrs Lillian Wideman
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - Yes

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes




Ms Eleanor James - Yes
Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Passed.
Resignation of Personnel

The Superintendent recommends the adoption of a motion to approve the resignation of
personnel as stipulated in Exhibit G2 herein.

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE
Certificated Resignations
Devin D Embry-Mitchell UHS/Principal 08/23/2023

Motion made by: Ms Eleanor James
Motion seconded by: Mrs Lillian Wideman
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - Yes

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Passed.
Employment of Personnel

The Superintendent recommends the adoption of a motion to approve the employment of
personnel as stipulated in Exhibit G3 herein.

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE CERT
Certificated
1. La'Tresta M Deaver-Maxwell UHS/TEAMS -Science 08/08/2023 Yes
2. Gary Sturdivant LJHS/TEAMS - Math 08/08/2023 Yes
3. Talicia Williams UHS/TEAMS - Math 08/08/2023 Yes
4. Britney Nash SCHS/History 08/08/2023 Emg
5. LaSonya J Norwood-Easterling SCHS/Math 08/08/2023 Emg
Classified
6. Billy L Noble . BELL/Custodian 05/27/2023
7. Sherlaine V Samuel TRAN/Bus Driver 08/08/2023
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - No

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Passed.



Approve the Employment of Interim Principal

The Superintendent recommends adoption of a motion to approve the employment of
interim principal as provided under separate cover herein.

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION REPLACING EFFECTIVE DATE CERT
Certificated
Rashard Jemison LJH/Interim Principal Devin Mitchell 07/28/2023 Yes

Motion made by: Mrs Lillian Wideman
Motion seconded by: Ms Eleanor James
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - No

Mrs Jeanette Payne - No

Ms Darla Spencer - No

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Fail.
Approve Administrative Stipends

The Superintendent recommends the adoption of a motion to approve the Administrative
Stipends as stipulated in Exhibit G5 herein.”

Rashard Jemison LJH/Interim Principal $50.00 per day

No Action Taken.
Approve the Employment of Principal and Probationary Contract

The Superintendent recommends adoption of a motion to approve the employment of
principal and probationary contract as provided under separate cover herein.

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION _REPLACING __ EFFECTIVE DATE CERT

Certificated
Barbara Ngbwa-Ntse YWE/Principal  Luther Riley 07/28/2023 Yes

Motion made by: Mrs Lillian Wideman
Motion seconded by: Ms Eleanor James
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - No

Mrs Jeanette Payne - No

Ms Darla Spencer - No

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

Motion Fail.



7. Approve the Sub Bus Driver

The Superintendent recommends adoption of a motion to approve the employment of sub
bus driver as stipulated in Exhibit G6 herein. herein.

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE
Classified
Charles E Williams TRAN/Sub Bus Driver 08/10/2023

Motion made by: Ms Eleanor James
Motion seconded by: Ms Darla Spencer
Voting:

Mrs. Beretha Washington - Not Present
Ms Sharon Nelson - Yes

Mrs Jeanette Payne - Yes

Ms Darla Spencer - Yes

Ms Eleanor James - Yes

Mrs Lillian Wideman - Yes

EXECUTIVE SESSION

ADJOURN

Clean-up Day
July 29, 2023 - Sumter Central High School
August 5, 2023 - York West End Junior High School

Meeting Adjourn at 5:39 pm



ACTION AGENDA ( New / Unfinished Business) Item No:

Item: CNP Bid - Produce
Background Information:

SUMTER COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
CHILD NUTRITION PROGRAM

PRODUCE BID OPENING
BID NUMBER: 2023-PRODUCE
June 22, 2023
Sumter Central High School

PP

Exhibit:

F1

10:30 a.m.
Items 1-64 (see attachments)

Forestwood

Farm, Inc. $36,507.75

Regional

Produce
Distributors, $51,832.50

LLC

Award Bid To: Regional Produce Distributors, LLC

Reasoning: The bid from Forestwood Farm, Inc. was not received sealed and labeled as

specified in the bid document.




Bid Pricing Form
Bid # 2023-Produce

June 22, 2023. 10:30 a.m.

Due Date/Time

Bidders must list something in every item listed, If you are not bidding that item, put “no bid” in the block. Failure
to write a price or “no bid” in every item will result in your bid being rejected. Prices are not to exceed three (3)

decimal places.

(A)
Item
No.

(B)
Est.

Qty.

©
Deseription/Unit

(D)
Market
Cost

(E)
Distrib,
Fee

(F)
Unit Sell Price
(D) +(E)

(G)
Extended
Price
(B) +(F)

1 50

Apples, Red Delicious, fresh,
Washington Fancy, Extra Fancy, or
Eastern, U.S. No. | or Higler. Min,
40 Ib case. 110-113 Ci/Case

99.00

3.°°

g25.%°

1215.%°

Apples, Golden Delicious, fresh,
Washinglon Fancy, Extra Fancy, or
Eastern, U.S. No. | or Higher. Min.
40 Ib case, 113-125 Ct/Case

aq'ao

3.5

97.5°

1,e7.5°

Apples, Granny Smith, fresh, tarl
green apple, , U.S. No., | or Higher.
Min. 40 Ib case, 113-125 Ct/Case

2l."°

3.5°

2959

295.%%

Apple Slices, US No. |, individually
packaged, 100/20z. package/case

2 8.7

35°

31,57

15475."°

5 75

Bananas, fresh, green #3 color,
medium size, 40#/case

4.

3,90

17.5°

131a.57

6 25

Broccoli Florets, fresh cut, prepared
from U.S. No. 1 or higher, 6/3%/Casc

A TS

3.5°

30'95/

75%.9°

7 10

Broccoli Florets, fresh cut, prepared
from U.S. No. | or higher, 3/3¢/Casc

[4.75

"

18«‘95‘

| 83,59

Broceoli Florets, Iresh cut, prepared
from U.S. No. [ or higher, #3 bag

577

3.59

g%

98.%

Cabbage, Green, fresh. U.S. No. | or
higher, 50#/Case

13'00

3.50

“!.50

/(pSs oo

10 10

| Cabbage, Red, fresh cut, shredded,

uniformity cut 1/8-1/4, gas permeable
packaging, code-dated. 54 bag

(.50

3,80

gléo

80 oD

11 25

Cabbage, Slaw Shred w/Carrots and
Red cabbage, 4/54 Case

[l

1489

47,2

12 10

Cantaloupe, fresh, U.S. No, I. 12
count/case

5.

[£.5°

}g 00

13 50

Carrot Sticks, fresh, U.S. no. 1 or
higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite free, code dated, 4/54/Case

Ab’°

A.5°

475.°

14 50

Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S. No. |
or higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite free, code dated, 4/5/Case

’q|w

)35 %

15 20

Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S. No. |
or higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite free, code dated, 2/54 hae/Case

ID 00

16 10

Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S. No. |
or higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite frec, code dated, S Ib/Case

657

17 10

Cauliflower, Norel, fresh, U.S. No. |
or higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite free, code dated, 4/55/Case

%00

L 18 25

Celery, Diced, fresh, U.S. No. | or
higher, gas permeable packaging,
sulfite free. code dated, 4/54/Case

aH.”




(G)

(A) (B) © (D) (E) (F)
[tem Est. Description/Unit Market Distrib. Unit Sell Price Extended
No. Qty. Cost Fee (D) + (E) Price
— (B) + (F)
Celery Sticks, fresh, U.S. No. 1 or ) o?
higher, gas permeable packaging, D 0 0 .
19 S0 sulfite free, code dated, 4/5#/Case g 1/ ' 8 '6 901 '6 / [7"76‘
Cucumbers, fresh, select. .S, No. | o0 SO 5 0 _0‘0
20 100 or higher, 5§ bag Q' 8. O 6: 5“{0 '
21 10 Greens, Collards, Fresh Cut 6/2&/Case Iq, 00 3,57 QD ‘6 O &Dg'?/
e
22 10 Greens, Tumip, Fresh Cut 6/2# Case I /‘7{90 5,50 &0 460 &0 \S . o
0
Grapes, Red Seedless, fresh, U.S. No. 00 D ﬁ 5 0 ; 0
Gl S0 1, domestic, 18-20 #/Case Ql@' 3'5 ! 1 476'
Grapes, Green Scedless, fresh, U.S. od Ry 0 [0 ﬂ
i 25 No. 1. domestic, 18-20 #/Case 2 l b 3 ! 24!5 }al
. o0 50 o0
= Honeydew Melon, fresh, U.S. No. l, \ 50 l d
23 10 5-9 count/Case '{ 3 ’ 8 ! Igs" -
Kiwi Fruit, fresh, U.S. No. I,
26 10 domestic preferred, packed in single ,75/ b/D & 50
layer flats or volume fill, 36 &
count/case ’3' 3, QD ‘ 72Da N
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded, Fresh, ob 5 O q S’D ‘_‘} 60
7 i U.S. No. 1 or higher, 4/5#/Casc { b ' 5' ’ ' g ,7’ o
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded, Fresh,
28 10 U.S. No. 1 or higher, 5# (/’ i (O 3. {0 g‘ o4 80 . 0
29 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Fresh, U.S. No, | 00 D D
or higher, 3 heads ' 3 '“iﬁ (3 9 (J 0'- 00.
30 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Fresh, U.S. No. |
or higher, 24 counts per case Q 2) 'DO 6 t Qlﬂ' 50 @!5 =
Lettuce, Romaine, Chopped, Fresh, 0
. 50 | US-No.lorhigher, 62¢ BagsiCase | 7] P 0 K :50 20 50 1625, 2
32 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Chopped, Fresh, L )
U.S. No. 1 or higher, 24 Bag a ¢ 96’ 3,@ (é' S & ,7‘&?
Lettuce Spring Mix. Fresh, gas 0
permeable packaging, sulfile frec, 50 ()’D D 0 -~ O
5 - code dated, 2/1.5%/Case g ! 3 ‘ / Q IQ 0. —
Lettuce Green Leaf, Fresh, gas o 0 5—? - D
< permeable packaging, sulfite free, i ! 9
34 25 cade dated, 4/5# bags/Case ‘ g > 3' gl U 55 7'
35 25 Nectarines, fresh, 2 layer, U.S, No, | o - NP -
or higher, 88 ct. l Q‘Q' 5 ¢ 6‘0 mf)O . b [é %7: S
36 25 Onions, Diced, 5% Bag 4 o0 3 50 s, 50 RIR,.860
37 10 Onions, Yellow, dry, fresh, U.S. No. 00 i SO oD
1, medium size, 50 # Bag ’g . 3 150 c;)l: 3 'f'
38 10 Onions, Yellow, dry, fresh, U.S. No. o0 00
1, medium size, 5# bag 3 ¢ 3 '6-0 é’ D? .
39 75 Oranges, fresh, naval or temple O [ {D 50
’ Valencia varietics, U.S. No. lor .
higher, 113-138 ct. QD o 3‘ 934 O’D I 7&2 -7
40 25 Pears, Bartlett, fresh, U.S. No. 1 or 1/ =
higher, 120 ct. ;’5' 8 ‘év /;78'50 7} Q'b
41 25 Peppers, Green, Diced, U.S. No. | or g
higher, gas permeable packaging, r] 6 [0 3 5/0 I ’ 00 ’2 )7 00
sulfite free. code dated, 5# Bag { ' ] v
4 1 Peppers, Green Bell, fresh, U.S. No. | s pj
. 0 or Higher, medium size, 5¥ bag lpo 3 ’ 6'2 ‘-7 1‘5—0 /7 ¢




(A) (B) © (D) (E) (F) (G)

Item Est. Description/Unit Market Distrib. Unit Sell Price | Extended Price

No. Qty. Cost Fee (D) +(E) (B) +(F)
Peppers, Red Bell, fresh, U.S. No. | p0 &0 50 q 00

43 19 hiephpcr. met;iumflarg::cssizc. Sit ba: - (0' 3 ’ q { b 6-'

44 25 Plums, Red, fresh, US. No. 1 or 00 \{D D
higher, 2" diameter, Volume Fill, app. SO Cr7 O
e e | ) 20 | 350 | 2350 |557
Potatoes, Russet, white, fresh, U.S. No. 5 D oo

4 10 | or higher,uloo co::u perr:Sa;e ° 32' bo 5' 351@ 975 '

Potatoes, Sweet, fresh, cello pack, U.S. o0

0|10 | Tamoes Swech fesh, cllo pac 1L.2° 1 g5° [ 952 )95

47 10 | Radishes, Red, fresh, U.S. No. 1, 6 oz, | L{O 3 ﬂ 3 40 39 o0
bag ] ’ P & ¢
Spinach, baby, fresh, cello packed, d

48 10 :t:;mcd and washed code dated 2.5# L},'Oﬂ 3‘ﬂ 7,51) 17 5 . 0

0

49 10 | Sauash, Yellow, U.S. #18 /3,0 3. 5—; Na,S 0 1 S/_()G‘ ]
Strawberrics, fresh, US. No. 1. 12 . L) = ' -‘Dﬂ

50 10 pints/case L ‘6. . 3,‘5 _B‘SD ?%g:o .
Tangerines, Florida, fresh, U.S. No.

51 25 lo?h?ghcr, max Il.‘ZO count 5?0 -00 3.(0 35 i S/o ;)35/; p(/

52 75 Tomatoes, fresh, U.S, No. I, Vine 00 /O
ipened, medium to large size, loo "O b
g e © | (17 | ZS0 | 50|78,
Tomaloes, fresh, U.S. No. 1. vine
ipened, medi large size, 5x6 2% <D 8] q 50

= e ) (27 | 35° 110670 | 9y,

5 Tomatoes, Grape, fresh, U.S, No, I, 0

= 15 rip::lisosesstag‘éag-ﬁ, ;?stlim/casco l L/! 'O 3 '(}/D 17(617 ;aea .53
Watermelon, Seediess, fi h, whole,

T E GRS | AP0 550 | 765 | |87.60

56 25 Eggs, Fresh Extra Large, 15 doz. I g‘ ,0a 3 ’ 6’D Q, ,b? 537,63

57 25 Cantaloupe/Honeydew Mix , US No. 1,
individually pack. 00 X2 4 é 19
mnin Sy 28 [ 352 | 5.5 | LA

58 25 Pineapple Chunks, US No, 1, D 0 fD
individually packaged, 100/207. 57
sgens "Bt | | 557 | 250 7575 o

59 50 Red Seedless Grapes, US No. I, o0 Vi
individually packaged, 1 00/207 50 SO
;Jacllzlz:g:/ca)se 1e F0 d~ jﬁ\' 3‘ 39 'b I QQ5

60 50 Orange Slices, US No. 1, individually [)] 00
packaged, 100/20z, packngelc;scufg 2{.(‘ cj ;S—O 2{6 l‘.‘:g ’ q75'

61 50 Lettuce and Tomato, Salad Pack, US 0 )
No. 1, individually packaged, 50/1 <0 ;Xb o
e T 267 |3.57 | B0 [)4a5.°0

62 50 Spring Mix, Salad Pack, US No. 1. >0 0
individually packaged, $0/1 SO ~D §7‘7

gt ™ |28 | 3,80 | 315 | o5
63 50 Carrot Sticks, US No. I, individually 0 )
kaged, 50/ % Kage/casc, 0 0 o
{Jvz;‘cjrzsgsemg 2 cup package/case w 5 g ;25 ; 6-'0 I /75 p
64 50 Celery Sticks, US No. 1, individually D

packaged, 50/ % cup package/case,
w/dressing

1"“




Bidders must list something in ev
to write a price or “no bid” in ey

decimal places.

Bid Pricing Form

Bid # 2023-Produce

June 22, 2023, 10:30 a.m.

Due Date/Time

ery item listed. If you are not bidding that item, put “no bid”
ery item will result in your bid being rejected. Prices

in the block. Failure
are not to exceed three (3)

[ @& (B) © - ) (E) ®) (G)
Item Est. Description/Unit Market Distrib. Unit Sell Price Extended
No. Qty. Cost Fee D) + E). Price

L | ®B) + (F)
Apples, Red Delicious, fresh, |- 9
Washington Fancy, Extra Fancy, or D,Z
A W | Saem bis No. 1 or Higher. Min, g0 Q ) 9.00 |, 450.@

40 Ib case, 110-113 Ct/Case ;
Apples, Golden Delicious, fresh,
Washington Fancy, Extra Fancy, or =7

2 25 Eastern, U.S. No. | or Higher. Min. ;l(? 0 O O ;l 7. ﬂ& / 95. O_Q
40 Ib case, 113-125 Ct/Case
Apples, Granny Smith, fresh, tart |, G
green apple, . U.S. No. 1 or Higher. | © 3 g 7000 )

3 10 Min. 40 1b case, 113-125 CvCase 9\9 0 0 O ‘;Z q 00
Apple Slices, USNo. |, individually »

4 50 packaged, 100/20z. package/case SC g§ O 3 c gf // g "/;‘50
Bananas, fresh] green #3 color, i : G e -

5 75 medium size, 40%/case =L/.0 0 O 9\/ GO }/ 57258, V9]
Broccoli Florets, fresh cut, prepared

6 25 from U.S. No. | orhigher, 6/3#/Casc 3 G go O 3 G 6 0 ?ﬂa 7o

12



Broccoli Florets, fresh cut, prepared
7 10 from U.S. No. 1 orhigher, 3/3#/Case Qo .00 L0 .00 200 00
Broccoli Florets, fresh cut, prepared
" 10__| from US. No. I or higher. #3 bag | 7. 7 0 7.00 70.00
Cabbage, Green, fresh. U.S. No. 1 or
9 10 higher, 50#/Casc 18.00 0o /5.ﬂ U /80-00
Cabbage, Red, fresh cut, shredded,
uniformity cut 1/8-1/4, gas permeable .00 A a 3000
10 10 Q - . =
packaging, code-dated, 54 bag
Cabbage, Slaw Shred w/Carrots and
11 25 Red cabbage, 4/5# Casc &/ 00 0 Aldco Cl[)-~0 4
12 10 Cantaloupe, fresh, U.S. No. 1,12 "L
count/case ) as. a0 5. 0 4 o’ 9-00
Carrot Sticks, fresh, U.S. no. 1 or .
. higher, gas permeable packaging, - L/ o / 00,
13 50 sulfite free, code dated, 4/5#/Casc 3 -7 s 8 <7/ 0 0 { 7 9 i
E Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S. No. 1 / / J 5
‘ or higher, gas permeable packaging, .00 Q - = 20, ¢
14 50 sulfite free, code dated, 4/54/Case Q‘ g (l 0 /0 4
Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S. Na. 1 ) Y / Z
or higher, gas permeable packaging, <. 7 00
I3 = sulfite free, code dated. 2/5# bag/Case A L \o- 0 %
| Carrots, Shredded, fresh, U.S, No. 1 C 0 é_
or higher, gas permeable packaging, .00 a . ,
1s 1 sulfite free. code dated, 5 Ib/Case g 5 7 20
17 10 Cauliflower, floret, fresh, U.S. No. 1 3
or higher, gas permeable packaging, . C Jd 0 3[0 e
sulfite free, code dated, 4/5#/Case 3 g ﬂO O i .
Celery, Diced, fresh, U.S. No. 1 or |- .
higher, gas permeable packaging, L{—7 .00 Q 9/7 o / 0J0.
18 5 : sulfite free, code dated. 4/5#/Casc - . <-0 ¢ g 00
(A) (B) © (D) (E) o (F) ©)
Item Est. Description/Unit Market Distrib. Unit Sell Price Extended
No. Qty. Cost Fee (D) +®) Price
: " B)+(F)
Celery Sticks, fresh, U.S. No. 1 or _3 4/ g0 3 (/ .
higher, gas permeable packaging, . 0 do
19 50 sulfite free, code dated, 4/5%/Case - . /' 790 . O
20 100 ’ Cucumbers, fresh, sclect, U.S. No. 1 | /.5 . Q0 O 1S 7o //fﬂo 00
or higher, 5# bag )
21 10 Greens, Collards, Fresh Cut 6/2#/Case Q\ L(I 00 e Q, ('/ /¥ a k'/ﬂ 20
22 10 Greens, Turnip, Fresh Cut 6(2# Casc 1 L/”& ¢ 2 ‘/-ﬂ/ a (/ﬂ 20
Grapes, Red Seedless, fresh, U.S, No. .00 ' . / 5.
23 30 1, domestic, 18-20 #/Case A1 e L7-00 // Y50-9¢
) : Grapes, Green Scedless, frcsh,.U.S. ; .0 N, IS -
#4 B | ot Aot o #/Case 4790 0 A7-00 deaatiia
25 10 HoneydewMelon, fresh, U.S. No. 1, w. 0¢ 0 a,.f 0 0 15@ o¢
5-9 count/Case
. . Kiwi Fruit, fresh, U.S. No. T, !
domestic preferred, packed in single
26 10 layer flats or volume fill, 36 /g Q 0 O /g_ e C) . /(2‘7 G Py
count/case i
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded, Fresh, 2L3-0 Q ). 3 . YN :
27 25 U.S. No. 1 or higher, 4/5%/Case 0 @ O - 4 = 4 0
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded, Fresh, ’
28 10 | US.No. 1 or higher, 5# €.l L 5.00 )
29 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Fresh, U.S. No. 1 Yy, P T Fo, ) “0-00

13



or higher, 3 hcads

30 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Fresh, U.S. No. 1
or higher, 24 counts per case 25 Q9 0 Q &.\f- Q (9] l-S-Q W00
Lettuce, Romaine, Chopped, Fresh,
31 50 | US-No. I orhigher, 624 Bags/Case | D) S 0 o 25, 00 / 1250, 00
32 10 Lettuce, Romaine, Chopped, Fresh,
U.S. No. 1 or higher, 2# Bag 5-90 Q 5.00 S0.99
Lettuce Spring Mix, Fresh, gas
permeable packaging, sulfite free, ) . / 0.
3 il B 2/1.5%/Case 3.0 0 4 /3. 00 30.0 0
Lettuce Green Leaf, Fresh, gas =
permeable packaging, sulfite free, S (:x -0
34 25 code dated, 4/5% bags/Case ‘Q; 2% Q :l 00 !
35 25 Nectarines, fresh, 2 layer, U.S. No. 1 [ ;
__| or higher, 88 ct. ‘2‘500 e A5, (X% O;{s.ge
36 25 Onions, Diced, 5% Bag 7.0 0 ) 9.00 .0¢
37 10 Onions, Yellow,dry, fresh, U.S. No. : : ,
1. medium size, 50 # Bag ) /5a¢ G /X-ﬂo /8’0»90
38 10 . | Onions, Yellow, dry, fresh, U.S. No. . ; . ]
l.mediumsize,S#bag (0. ¢ 4 g . /0. 00 /{*0'00
39 75 Oranges, fresh, naval or temple
Valencia varieties, U.S. No. lor g
higher, 113-138 ¢, A7.09 0 22 .00 L 17) . 00
" 40 25 Pears, Bartlett, fresh, U.S. No. | or ' ..
higher, 120 ct. 35 70 q 3 3 -00 89\5 1 00
41. 25 Peppers, Green, Diced, U.S. No. 1 or // 0 //
higher, gas permeable packaging, -V ) -
sulfite free, code dated, 5# Bag ﬂ 40 &7£ <00
42 10 Peppers, Green Bell, fresh, U.S. No. 1 .
or Higher. medium size, 5# bag (g 7q ¢ ’d. a7 /09.0@
A) - (B) © D) - (E) . ¥ (&)
Item Est. Description/Unit Market Distrib. Unit Sell Price | Extended Price
No. Qty. : - Cost Fee D) + (E) - (B) + (F)
Peppers, Red Bell, fresh, U.S. No. | or ; J
43 10 higher, medium-large size, 5# bag 15 -00 O / 5 0 0 /S-Q 09
44 25 P_lums, Rcc_i, fresh, U.S. Nq. 1 or :
_ %%h?ués diameter, Volume'Fxll, app. QQ a0 o &g 0¢ Cfg C00
45 10 Potatoes, Russet, white, fresh, U.S. No. i
1 or higher, 100 count per case :’2'6 g0 a ;L[ 00 (..j\ QQ .00
46 10 Potatoes, Sweet, fresh, cello pack, U.S, ) )
No. 1, small, 90 ct. X .00 0 20y /0.00
47 10 Radishes, Red, fresh, U.S. No. 1,6 0z / [ o, 0 / 00 /O N 00
bag : . . : . j
Spinach, baby, fresh, cello packed, C C g CoT . )
steamed and washed code dated 2.5%# .0 0o
48 10 Bsa .0 .0 . C G, 0o
49 10 Squash, Yellow, U.S. #18§ LY 00 Q A %00 = Y0.¢0
Strawberries, fresh, U.S. No. 1. 12
50 10 pints/case Q-C-Qa Q &5,40 Q\:C~OD
. Tangerines, Florida, fresh, U.S. No. .
51. 25 lor higher, max 120 count 2‘?. g 0 9\7 ‘a0 7 95‘ Co
52 75 Tomatoes, fresh, U.S. No. I, Vine
ripened, medium to large size, loose | /7 . o ()
pack, 10#case Z— Q O /2 . OO 670«3400
Tomatoes, fresh, U.S. No. 1, vine | g :) -
ripened, medium 1o large size, 5x6 . YA
53 15 loose pack, 25%case :;l. 79 g :2 5 oo 2. ‘00
54 15 Tomatoes, Grape, fresh, U.S. No. 1, R
ripeness stage g-G. 12 pint/cusAc ;"; ‘Oo o 9\? -9 0 ~ (/ﬁ 0o
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55 25 Watermelon, Seedless, fresh, wholc,
U.S. No. 1 or higher. Min. 3 per case 7’ Q0 Q 770 /7f /0

56 25 Eggs, Fresh Extra Large, 15 doz, 25/ a0 0 2 5. Q0 79 0. 00
57 25 Cantaloupe/Honeydcw Mix, USNo. 1, 6'
individually packaged, 10020z .00
package/case l @ C; .0p // )/7fr 09
58 25 Pineapple Chunks, US No. I,
individually packaged, 100/20s2, ] L(/ -0 3
_| package/casc Eﬁ/ gt ¢ 8 0 3“'/ /ﬂp 00
59 50 Red Seedless Grapes, US No. L;
individually packaged, 100/207. 75.00 0} 78 e, 3/ qgﬂ 0¢

package/casc

60 50 .| Orange Slices, USNo. T, individually ﬁ' 72 Op @) ,72, .00 3/ Gﬂﬂ 00

packaged, 100/20z. package/case
61 50 Lettuce and Tomato, Salad Pack, US
No. 1. individually packaged, 50/1 cup 5000 o, Se .oy <, So0 0

package/case, w/dressing
62 50 Spring Mix, Salad Pack, US No. 1,
individually packaged, 50/ cup : 5ﬂ Q¢ 0] $0. ¢q ’D\{foo, 0p

package/case, w/dressing
63 50 Carrot Sticks, US No. 1, individually 3 (7 0
.00 O | 390, 11550
: 200
e (/L/ 29 2 /-:). Q0

packaged, 50/ 14 cup package/case,

w/dressing -

64 50 Celery Sticks, US No. 1, individually ,
packaged, 50/ ¥4 cup package/case, (7/(/‘ O¢

w/dressing :

--7;‘\5’/ F32.5,

U.S. DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

Certification Regarding Debarment, Suspension,; Ineligibility
and Voluntary Exclusion-Lower Tier Covered Transaction

transaction originated.
(BEFORE COMPLETING CERTIF ICATION, READ INSTRUCTIONS) :
(1) The prospective lower tier participant certifies, by submission of this proposal, that neither it nor
its principals is presently debarred, suspended proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or

voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction by any Federal department or agency.

(2) Where the prospective lower tier participant is unable to certify to any of the statements in this
certification, such prospective participant shall attach an explanation to this proposal. :

Sumter County Board of Education Bid # 2023-PRODUCE
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ACTION AGENDA ( New / Unfinished Business) Item No:

pp

Item: CNP Bid - Tables Exhibit;

Background Information:

SUMTER COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
CHILD NUTRITION PROGRAM

CAFETERIA TABLE BID OPENING
BID NUMBER: 2023-CNP TABLES
June 22, 2023
Sumter Central High School
11:30 a.m.

F1

*** The following bid quotes include delivery and installation of new tables and removal of existing ones at LJHS. ***

Vendor 20, Cafeteria Tables (seating for 224)
Interior $47,700.00

Elements
Terrell $56,443.20

Enterprises

Ingenious
Culinary $50,150.40

Concepts

Award Bid To: Terrell Enterprises

Reasoning: Interior Elements bid items alternative to the specifications listed in the bid.
“‘Approved equal” items to be bid were to be submitted 7 calendar days prior to bid opening.
Ingenious Culinary Concept’s bid was not received prior to the bid opening. The lead time
(delivery/installation) specified in the bid for this company is 16-20 weeks after a purchase
order is received. The company did not have the list of installations within the state specified in
the bid. The lead time specified in the bid for Terrell Enterprises is 10 weeks after a purchase

order is received.



Rescind Non-Renewal of Personnel

ACTION AGENDA ( New / Unfinished Business) Item No: pp
Item: Rescind Employment of Personnel Exhibit: G1
Background Information:

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE

Classified

Billy L Noble BELL/Custodian 05/27/2023

' Applying for Alabama certification via an alternative approach
% Certificated employee in a classified position
Recommendation: That the Board approve the assignments as submitted hereinabove.

Date: July 26, 2023 Submitted by:

The Superintendent concurs in this recommendation and submits same for Board consideration for approval.

Date: Superintendent:

Thursday, July 27, 2023



Resignation of Personnel

ACTION AGENDA ( New / Unfinished Business) Item No: pp
Item: Resignations of Personnel Exhibit: __G2
Background Information:

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE

Certificated Resignations

Devin D Embry-Mitchell LJHS/Principal 08/23/2023

" Applying for Alabama certification via an alternative approach
2 Certificated employee in a classified position
Recommendation: That the Board approve the retirement and resignations of the personnel mentioned hereinabove.

Date: July 26, 2023 Submitted by:

The Superintendent concurs in this recommendation and submits same for Board consideration for approval.

Date: Superintendent:

Thursday, July 27, 2023
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Employment of Personnel

ACTION AGENDA ( New / Unfinished Business) Item No: pp
Item: Employment of Personnel Exhibit:
Background Information:

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE CERT

Certificated

La'Tresta M Deaver-Maxwell LJHS/TEAMS -Science 08/08/2023 Yes

Gary Sturdivant LJHS/TEAMS - Math 08/08/2023 Yes

Talicia Williams LJHS/TEAMS - Math 08/08/2023 Yes

Britney Nash SCHS/History 08/08/2023 Emg

LaSonya J Norwood-Easterling SCHS/Math 08/08/2023 Emg

Classified

Billy L Noble BELL/Custodian 05/27/2023

Sherlaine V Samuel TRAN/Bus Driver 08/08/2023

" Applying for Alabama certification via an alternative approach
% Certificated employee in a classified position
Recommendation: That the Board approve the assignments as submitted hereinabove.

Date: July 27, 2023 Submitted by:

The Superintendent concurs in this recommendation and submits same for Board consideration for approval.

Date: Superintendent:

Thursday, July 27, 2023



Sub Bus Driver

INFORMATION AGENDA Item No: pp
Exhibit: G5

Iltem: Employment of Personnel
Background Information:

NAME SCHOOL/POSITION EFFECTIVE DATE
Classified
Charles E Williams TRAN/Sub Bus Driver 08/10/2023

" Applying for Alabama certification via an alternative approach
2 Certificated employee in a classified position
Date: July 26, 2023 Submitted by:

The Superintendent concurs in the submission of this report for Board review.

Date: Superintendent:

Thursday, July 27, 2023



