BID ON: PAINT AND SUPPLIES - AS NEED UNTIL 1/31/23

BID NO: 22-13
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION BIDDER CODE NO. UNIT COST UNIT COST
1 GALLON 5 GALLON

1 Oil Base Exterior House Paint The Sherwin-Williams Co. Al1 Series 23.55 XXX
Acrylic Latex Exterior Gloss House Paint

2 Super White The Sherwin-Williams Co. A8 Series $16.50 $82.50

3 Ready Mix Factory Stock Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. A8 Series $16.50 $82.50

4 Tinting Base and Custom Mix Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. A8 Series $16.50 $82.50

5 Ultra Deep Tint & Accent The Sherwin-Williams Co. A8 Series $16.50 $82.50
Latex Interior Flat Wall Paint

6 Super White The Sherwin-Williams Co. B30 Series $14.00 $70.00

7 Ready Mix Factory Stock Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. B30 Series $14.00 $70.00

8 Tinting Base and Custom Mix Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. B30 Series $14.00 $70.00

9 Ultra Deep Tint & Accent The Sherwin-Williams Co. B30 Series $14.00 $70.00

10 Floor and Deck Enamel The Sherwin-Williams Co. B54-15 Series 21.55 XXX
Gloss Oil Enamel

11 White Gloss Enamel, Interior/Exterior The Sherwin-Williams Co. B54 Series $19.00 XXX

12 Ready Mix Factory Stock Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. B54 Series $19.00 XXX

13 Tint Base and Custom Mix Colors The Sherwin-Williams Co. B54 Series $19.00 XXX

14 Ultra Deep Tint & Accent The Sherwin-Williams Co. B54 Series $19.00 XXX



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25
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Latex Enamel Interior Semi-Gloss
Super White

Pastel Tint Base
Custom Mix Colors
Ultra Deep Tint & Accent

Oil Base, Enamel Interior Semi-Gloss
Super White

Ready Mix Factory Stock Colors

Tinting Base and Custom Mix Colors
Ultra Deep Tint & Accent

Enamel Undercoat, Interior

Oil Base Wood Primer Exterior

Enamel Metal Primer Interior and Exterior
Polyurethane Varnish

Two Component Water Based Epoxy
Universal Red Primer

Thinner

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION

BIDDER

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

BIDDER

CODE NO.

B31 Series

B31 Series

B31 Series

B31 Series

B34 Series

B34 Series

B34 Series

B34 Series

B79 Series

Y24 Series

B50 Series

Minwax

B70 Series

E61 Series

SW Solvent

CODE NO.

UNIT COST

1 GALLON

14.75

14.75

14.75

14.75

$17.50

$17.50

$17.50

$17.50

$17.00

19.25

20.55

19.25

30.55

XXX

XXX

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

5 GALLON

73.75

73.75

73.75

73.75

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

152.75

$69.00

39.99

UNIT COST
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Street Marking Paint
Red

White

Yellow

Blue

Paint and Varnish Remover Semi-Paste

Surface Conditioner

Ready Mixed, Water Thinned, Non Aggregate

Latex Filler

Lacquer Thinner
5 gal.

1 gal.
Stain Killer

Mineral Spirits
5 gal.

1 gal.

Bright Aluminum Coating

Exterior Spar Gloss Varnish (Gallon)
Water Proofing Sealer, Clear (Gallon)
Min-Wax Stain (Gallon)

Heavy Duty Paint Roller and Handle

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

BIDDER

SW Traffic
SW Traffic
SW Traffic
SW Traffic
Stripeze

Deglosser

B42 Series

SW Solvent
SW Solvent

B79 Series

SW Solvent
SW Solvent
B59 Series
Minwax
Seal-Krete
Minwax

1801497
CODE NO.

1 GALLON

15.25

14.25

14.25

15.25

24.25

13.55

XXX

XXX

10.85

18.95

XXX

9.55

29.99

28.85

12.95

24.55

3.85
UNIT COST

5 GALLON

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

XXX

$42.00

49.95

XXX

XXX

45.85

XXX

No Bid Received

XXX

XXX

XXX

UNIT COST
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Paint Trays, 4 Qt. Capacity, Plastic

Spackling Compound
Quart

Gallon

Glazing Compound (gallon)

1/2" x 9" Roller Cover

3/4" x 9" Pure Lambswool Roller Cover
1" x 9" Pure Lambswool Roller Cover
3/4" x 9" Synthetic Roller Cover

1" x 9" Synthetic Roller Cover

Filter Masks. Box of 50

100% Acrylic Latex Caulk

Silicon Sealant
Black

Bronze
Clear
Gray
Metallic

White

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

BIDDER

1709385

1510619

1510817

4042271

650970890

1551464

1806488

650970916

650970957

SW

1050 Quick Dry

SW Sealant

SW Sealant

CODE NO.

1 GALLON

2.55

5.85

16.99

37.95

2.85

5.95

8.75

2.95

3.22

26.85

1.75

4.98

4.98

UNIT COST

5 GALLON

UNIT COST
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Gloss Interior and Exterior 100% Latex Acrylic Enamel

Black

Blue

Orange
Green

Red

White
Yellow
Custom Colors
Jaquar Red
Royal Blue
Forest Green
Walnut

Gloss, Satin, and Flat Lacquers
Spraying Lacquers, clear, non-yellowing

Spraying Lacquers, stains
Pigmented Lacquers

Lacquer Sealer

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

BIDDER

B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series
B66 Series

B66 Series

SW Lacquer
SW Lacquer
SW Lacquer

SW Lacquer

CODE NO.

1 GALLON

26.55

26.55

29.35

26.55

34.55

26.55

34.55

26.55

$36.50

$36.50

$36.50

$36.50

28.55

28.55

28.55

28.55

UNIT COST

5 GALLON

UNIT COST
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90
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Gloss, Satin, and Flat Lacquers
Lacquer Retarder

High Gloss Rust Inhibiting Enamel
Black

Blue
Green
Orange
Red
White
Yellow

Jaquar Red
Royal Blue
Forest Green
Walnut

1-1/4 Synthetic Roller Cover

Glazing Compound, 10:1 - 10.3 oz. tube

Paint, Latex Traffic

Finish Coat, Hybrid Modified Alkyd Urethane
Finish Coat, Multi Surface Acrylic

Finish Coat, PreFinished metal Surfaces

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

The Sherwin-Williams Co.

NOTE: NO PAINT OR PAINT PRODUCTS MAY CONTAIN LEAD

SW Solvent

B54 Series

B54 Series

B54 Series

B54 Series

B54 Series

B54 Series

B54 Series

650970943

1755768

SW Traffic

B53 Series

B66 Series

B71 Series

1 GALLON

28.55

$23.00

$26.00

$26.00

$26.00

$26.00

$19.00

$26.00

3.25

6.99

15.25

32.99

$26.00

32.99

5 GALLON

164.95

$130.00

164.95



VENDOR ADDRESS

#13307
THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS CO.
1904 GOVERNMENT STREET
MOBILE, AL 36606
(251) 471-1438 PHONE
(251) 479-6006 FAX



