Superintendent of Schools
Dr. Richard Rogers

BID RESPONSE AWARD

Board Members
Dr. Rick Unruh, Chair Clyde Jackson, Jr.
WO R KS H E ET Dave Crockett, Vice Chair Lori Johnson
Helen Hughes Jon Nichols

Mark Ivory

BID#: 26-030

Vendor: Staples| Vendor:

DUE: FEBRURARY 18, 2026 @ 2:00PM (HiTouch) | National Art | Vendor: CPG | Vendor: Quill Vendor: Pyramid Vendor: School Specialty
PCard (Fee):

PCard (Fee): |PCard (Fee):|] PCard (Fee): | PCARD (Fee): | PCard (Fee): PCARD PCard (Fee): PCARD

Awarded To: Multiple Vendors YES/NONE NO YES/3% YES/NONE (Fee): YES/NONE (Fee): YES/NONE
Expiration; Expiration:
Expiration: 6 | Expiration: | MARCH 18, | Expiration: 6 | Expiration: Expiration: 6 | Expiration: Expiration: 6
MONTHS ] 12 MONTHS 2026 MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS
HCSD ITEM
4 DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL AWARDED TO:  UNIT COST  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BATTERY, AA, 1.5 VOLT, PACK/4 EVERREADY EVE-EN91 (or
11501250 |BATTERIES equal, send sample of other PACK 700 PYRAMID $4.75 $1.77 NO BID $2.99 $1.69 No Bid
brands.)
CHART TABLET, 24" X 32", RULED, 1-| APC APS2415 (or equal, send SCHOOL
16707670 1/2" W/BROKEN LINE, WHITE sample of other brands) EACH 100 SPECIALTY $5.98 NO BID NO BID $7.52 $4.95 $3.37
CRAYOLA 52-0836-038 (or SCHOOL
10500170 |CRAYONS, REFILL, STANDARD, BOX/{ equal, send sample of other BOX 5 | SPECIALTY $1.75 $0.78 NO BID $2.09 $0.69 $0.64
brands.)
ERASER, PINK PEARL BRAND
15752770 |PREFERRED, ERASES PENCIL PINK PEARL 70921 {or equal, DZ 125 | PYRAMID $5.87 $4.50 NO BID $5.99 $3.79 $5.94

MARKINGS send sample of other brands.)

MARKER, DRY ERASE, CHISEL TIP
16203130 FOR WHITEBOARDS, BLACK EXPO 80001 ONLY DZ 225 PYRAMID $10.08 $8.36 NO BID $9.93 $7.95 $14.21

MARKER, HIGHLIGHTER, TANK
16203210 STYLE, YELLOW SANFORD 25005 ONLY DZ 150 PYRAMID $5.64 $5.00 NO BID $6.93 $4.32 $6.87

MARKER, PERMANENT, FINE POINT, SANFORD SHARPIE 30001

BLACK ONLY DZ 100 PYRAMID $8.50 $6.90 NO BID $8.89 $6.69 $10.15

16203250




METER STICK, CHALKBOARD,

16606070 [WOODEN, GRADUATED IN ACME 1|04‘? t(r?r eg“a'ase”d EACH 50 Sigg&f'{Y $7.50 NO BID NO BID $6.48 $2.29 $1.13
CENTIMETERS/INCHES sample of other brands.)
PAINT, WATERCOLOR, OVAL, SET/8, | CRAYOLA 53-0080 (or equal,
10500640 425 | PYRAMID 57 1. NO BID 4 . 191
ASSORTED send sample of other brands.) SET BE e 0 el iz DIk
PAPER CLIP, BINDER CLIP, LARGE 2"
16606005 |1" CAPACITY, PLASTIC CLIP STAdPLES 1|O6?(9?§ (Obr qua" BOX 275 NAE%\'AL $1.89 $1.10 NO BID $1.96 $1.59 $1.27
W/HANDLES, BOX/12 Send sampie or otner oran S.)
PAPER CLIP, BINDER CLIP, SMALL
16606015 [3/4". 3/8" CAPACITY, PLASTIC CLIP STAPLEsl 15?5?h(°rbeq“3" send BOX 125 Si:g&f'ﬁ $0.55 $0.24 NO BID $0.83 $0.35 $0.21
W/HANDLES, BOX/12 sample of other brands.)
PACON TRU-RAY P103004 (o
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12" SCHOOL
16707395 804, PACK/50, YELLOW equal, send sample of other PACK 100 | <pEciALTY $2.85 NO BID NO BID $2.88 $2.69 $1.97
brands.)
16707405 |PAPER COPY, 11" X 17" WHITE FASCOPY f{or equal, send REAM 75 CPG $12.85 NO BID $9.79 $13.88 NO BID No Bid
sample of other brands.)
16707435 |PAPER. COPY, 85" X 11", GRAY AE GOLOR 4733050 (or equal, REAM 75 CPG $8.99 NO BID $6.10 $9.51 NO BID No Bid
send sample of other brands.)
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", AE COLOR 4767050 (or equal, |
16707450 | 0o ey send sample of other brancs) REAM 100 CPG $8.99 NO BID $6.10 $8.61 NO BID No Bid
16707460 |F/PER, COPY, 8.5" X117, NEON NEENAH 26781 (or equal, send REAM 100 | STAPLES $10.50 NO BID $12.95 $13.83 NO BID No Bid
BLUE sample of other brands.)
16707465 | APER COPY, 8.5 X 11, NEON NEENAH 26721 (or equal, send REAM 125 | STAPLES $10.50 NO BID $12.25 $12.97 NO BID No Bid
ORANGE sample of other brands.)
16707475 | ATER: COPY, 8.5TXTTE PINK AE COLOR 4763050 (or equal, REAM 75 CPG $8.99 NO BID $6.10 $8.77 NO BID No Bid
send sample of other brands.)
16707430 |PAPER COPY. 8.5" X 11" sALmoN | AE COLOR 4778050 (or equal, REAM 100 CPG $8.99 NO BID $6.10 $8.682 NO BID No Bid
send sample of other brands.)
16303305 |PEN, BALLPOINT, FINE POINT, BLACK| BIC GSFT1BK (or equal, send DZ 075 (I $1.25 $1.09 NO BID $1.41 $1.29 No Bid
sample of other brands.) ART




PEN, POINT GUARD, FLAIR PLASTIC

PAPERMATE 8430152 (or equal,

16303340 5 | PYRAMID 12.87 10.00 NO BID 11.94 8.28 14.36
POROUS, MEDIUM POINT, BLACK | send sample of other brands.) bz 8 3 $ $ 5
PEN, ROLLER BALL, MEDIUM, GEL  |SANFORD 65450 (or equal, send .

16303360 50 | STAPLES 121 12.98 NO BID 12,91 12.19 No Bid
GRIP, (INST), BLACK sample of other brands.) bz $2:1o $ $ $ 0Bi
PENCIL, COLORED, W/ ERASER,

16404015 |ASSORTED, PRE-SHARPENED, PRANG 22240 (or equa, send SET 25 | PYRAMID $4.50 NO BID NO BID $4.50 $2.29 $4.07

sample of other brands.)

SET/24

16404040 |PENCIL, W/ERASER, NO 2 DIXON 12872 or equal, send DZ o | NATIONAL L o) 45 §0.72 NO BID $1.46 $1.12 $1.30

sample of other brands.) ART

SCISSORS, PLASTIC HANDLE, ACME 13023/13403 (or equal,

16608115 |, CHERIOFFICE, LGHTWEIGHT, 8 | sond sample of oher brands) EACH 125 | PYRAMID $2.5 NO BID NO BID $2.26 $0.89 $2.40
SCISSORS, STAINLESS POINT, FISKARS 9458 (or equal, send NATIONAL

16606105 100 19.08 10. NO BID NO BID 3228 11.04
STUDENT, 7" sample of other brands.) bz ART $ $10.80 0 $ $
TAPE, CORRECTION, SINGLE LINE, | PAPERMATE 660415 (or equal,

13111350 EACH 350 | STAPLES 055 208 NO BID NO BID 209 2.70
DRYLINE DISPOSABLE, WHITE send sample of other brands.) ¢ $ : : :
TAPE, SCOTCH MAGIC, 3/4" X 72 | HIGHLAND 6200 (or equal, send NATIONAL |

16606280 100 1.98 0.70 NO BID 5.61 1.89 No Bid
YDS, 3" CORE sample of other brands.) ROLL ART : $ : : o8




