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BID# 25-022
SCHOOL Vendor: | Vendor: LIONS Vendor: SOUTHERN Vendor: Vendor: APEX Vendor: EMC Vendor: Henry | Vendor: CATEGORY
DUE: January 29, 2025 @ 2:00PM HEALTH QUILL INVESTORS PYRAMID | BELLE ROOM MEDCO OMNISOURCE PHARMA Vendor: DINOVO Schein ELITE
PCARD (Fee): (Fee): PCARD (Fee): | PCARD (Fee): | PCARD (Fee): | PCARD (Fee):| PCARD (Fee): PCARD (Fee): PCARD (Fee): | YES/$5.50 PER
Awarded To: Multiple Vendors YES/NONE | YES/NONE | YES/1.5% YES/ 5% YES/NO YES/NONE YES/1.5% YES/NONE PCARD (Fee): YES/3.5%| YES/none TRANSACTION
Expiration: 2 | Expiration: 6] Expiration: 6 | Expiration: 5 | Expiration: 7 | Expiration: 3 Expiration: 6 Expiration: 12 Expiration: Expiration: 12
MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS MONTHS Expiration: 12 MONTHS 12/30/25 MONTHS
HCS[;ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL AWARDED TO: ~ UNIT COST  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE ~ UNIT PRICE ~ UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
WIPES, CLOROX, BLEACH FREE,
69410830 |DISINFECTING WIPES CLOROX 49188 (or equal, send EACH 100 | Pyramid $6.70 gsgr |S1190.92100) o, $6.00 $7.31 $50.62 $9.06 $55.82 $7.73 Qry 10 @954.99
sample of other brands.) $126.00
MOUTHPIECE KIT, USE WITH
69410910 |NEBULIZER, INCLUDES 7' AIR KENTRON 333759 (or equal, KIT 5 ey $12.89 NO BID $72.50 NO BID $3.00 No Bid $72.00 $8.99 $51.90 $1.15 QTY 10 @$3.99
TUBING/ANGLED MOUTHPIECE send sample of other brands.) panein
TONGUE DEPRESSOR, 6" (SENIOR),
69410600 |STERILE, INDIVIDUALLY WRappep, | SCH HEALTH 80254 {or equal, BOX 5 Quil $9.00 $4.78 $19.29 NO BID §7.00 No Bid $41.58 $5.69 $5.28 $5.89 QTY 10 @$5.99
BOX OF 100 send sample of other brands.)




