ITEM

BID ON: RECYCLING & DISPOSAL SERVICES FOR FLUORESCENT LAMPS AND BATTERIES - AS NEEDED BASIS

PART ONE
DESCRIPTION

Recycling and Disposal of Straight
fluorescent lamps (uncrushed)

2 feet in length
3 feet in length
4 feet in length
8 feet in length
Price per foot

Recycling and Disposal of U-Bend or
circular lamps (uncrushed)

Recycling and Disposal of HID Bulbs
any watt (uncrushed)

Recycling and Disposal Services for
55 gallon drum of crushed fluorescent
lamps.

Recycling and Disposal of Ballasts-
PCB Containing

Recycling and Disposal of Ballasts-
Non - PCB Containing

UNIT

BID NO: 24-44

BIDDER

each Lighting Resources
each Lighting Resources
each Lighting Resources
each Lighting Resources
per ft Lighting Resources
each Lighting Resources
each Lighting Resources
drum Lighting Resources
per pound Lighting Resources
per pound Lighting Resources

UNIT COST

$0.12
$0.18
$0.24
$0.48
$0.06

$0.28

$0.75

$225.00

$5.95

$0.20

MIN. PICK UP



ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Recycling and Disposal of Batteries
A. Lead Acid - Sealed

B. Alkaline - Non-Mercury, Nickel
and Zinc

C. Mercury
D. Lithium
PART TWO
CONTAINER SCHEDULE
DESCRIPTION

4 - foot box, 30-39 4-foot lamps
8 - foot box, 30-39 8-foot lamps

T-26 Box without trays, 400-450 4-ft
lamps, 120 U-tubes

T-26 box with trays, 350 4-foot lamps
T-43 box without trays, 220 tubes
T-43 box with trays, 630 4-ft lamps
4-foot fiber drum, 90 4-ft lamps

4-foot fiber drum, 180 4-ft lamps

UNIT

per pound

per pound

per pound

per pound

PRICE
PER EACH

$4.50

$6.50

$0.00

BIDDER

Lighting Resources

Lighting Resources

Lighting Resources

Lighting Resources

BIDDER

Lighting Resources
Lighting Resources

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received
Lighting Resources

No Bid Received

UNIT COST MIN. PICK UP

$0.15

$0.75

$5.00

$5.00

Quantity Of Lamps The Box
Holds That Is Being Quoted

75-170 T5, T8, T12 (115-T8

35-18



ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT BIDDER
DESCRIPTION PRICE
PER EACH
9  8-foot fiber drum, 90 9-ft lamps No Bid Received
10 55 gallon steel drum No Bid Received

PICK UP WILL BE MADE WITHIN 10 WORKING DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER.

VENDOR ADDRESS

#113250
LIGHTING RESOURCES
1007 SW 16TH LANE
OCALA, FL 34471
(352) 509-3001 PHONE

UNIT COST

MIN. PICK UP
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