
BID ON:  DRUG AND ALCOHOL TESTING - HEALTH SERVICES
BID NO:  25-29
OPENED:  MAY 27, 2025 @ 2:00 PM

Drug and Alcohol Testing of employees with CDL, 50% drug testing, 10% alcohol testing.
Approximate population of 800 Regular and Substitute Drivers and other employees with CDL's. 
Drug & Alcohol testing for approximately 225 Non DOT employees driving system owned vehicles or  
heavy equipment

Item Description Bidder Charge per Test

1 Random Test

DOT
A. Drugs - Approximately 400 employees Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00

Behavioral Health Systems $39.50
OHC, Inc. $40.00

DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50
Nao Medical $55.00

B. Alcohol - Approximately 80 employees Fastest Labs Of Mobile $20.00
Behavioral Health Systems $22.50

OHC, Inc. $25.00
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $48.00

Nao Medical $55.00

Non DOT
A. Drugs - Approximately 75 employees OHC, Inc. $35.00

Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00
Behavioral Health Systems $39.50
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50

Nao Medical $60.00

B.  Alcohol - Approximately 23 employees Fastest Labs of Mobile $20.00
Behavioral Health Systems $22.50

OHC, Inc. $25.00
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $48.00

Nao Medical $55.00



Item Description Bidder Charge per Test

2 Other Drug and Alcohol Tests

A. Panel of prescription drugs Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00
Behavioral Health Systems $39.50

OHC, Inc. $45.00
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50

Nao Medical $60.00

B. Reasonable Suspicion Tests Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00
Behavioral Health Systems $39.50

OHC, Inc. $35, Breath Alcohol $25
Nao Medical $60.00

DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50 drug test/$48 alcohol test

C.  Post Accident Tests Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00
Behavioral Health Systems $39.50

OHC, Inc. $40 DOT/$35 Non-DOT
Nao Medical $60.00

DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50 drug test/$48 alcohol test

D.  Return to Duty/Follow-Up Testing Fastest Labs of Mobile $38.00
Behavioral Health Systems $39.50

OHC, Inc. $40 DOT/$35 Non-DOT
Nao Medical $60.00

DSI Medical Services, Inc. $45.50 drug test/$48 alcohol test

3 On Site Collecting Fastest Labs of Mobile $35.00 per hour
Behavioral Health Systems $37.50 per hour Unlimited

OHC, Inc. $50.00 per hour Minimum 2 hours, $0.75 per mile
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $75.00 per hour Min 2 hrs, to $200/hr (min 2 hrs)

*See Variance Sheet plus .75/mile  (based on time of
*See Below day/night)

Nao Medical $300 per specimen discounts on larger groups and
events, no on-site fee on 25-30

collections together



Item Description Bidder Charge Per Session No. Employees allowed
per session

4 Employee training sessions

A. Drug awareness for employees Behavioral Health Systems online $40.00 per user
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $49.00 per end-user license

(or purchase up to 100 licenses
for $1,400 total to mix & 
match between employees

and/or supervisors)
Nao Medical $150 per session

online material free of cost
OHC, Inc. $200.00 1 location, unlimited

Fastest Labs of Mobile NO BID

B. Supervisor Training Sessions Behavioral Health Systems One time annually in person
virtually at no cost

online $40.00 per user
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $49.00 per end-user license

Nao Medical $150 per session
online material free of cost

OHC, Inc. $200.00 1 location, 8
Fastest Labs of Mobile NO BID

Item Description Bidder Per Test

5 Annual Administration Fee Fastest Labs of Mobile $0.00
Behavioral Health Systems N/A
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $0.00

Nao Medical Included
OHC, Inc. $15/random pull



Item Description Bidder Per Test

6 Physical exams biannually for CDL renewal.
Approximately 200 - 450 employees annually

A. Physical OHC, Inc. $70.00
Behavioral Health Systems $75.00
DSI Medical Services, Inc. $99.00 in network

$130 out of network
Nao Medical $150.00

Fastest Labs of Mobile NO BID

B.  EKG's for drivers 65 years old & over OHC, Inc. $60.00
Behavioral Health Systems $60.00

Nao Medical $100.00
DSI Medical Services, Inc. Market Price

Fastest Labs of Mobile NO BID
*Note:
 Item #3: DSI Medical - Quoted range because it depends on the day and time of the event:
     M-F 7:30am - 5pm - $75 per hour (minimum 2 hours)
     M-F 5pm - 7:30am/all day weekends - $140 per hour (minimum 2 hours)
     All day Holidays - $200 per hour (minimum 2 hours)
     Plus additional $0.75/mile
Item #6:  Physicals are billed whether the clinic is identified as "IN" or "OUT"
     "IN" clinics include 5ive Star, OHC, USA Health
     "OUT" clinics include Fast Pace Urgent Cares

Additional Pricing as needed, DSI Medical:
     Split Specimen (Bottle B) Retest at a 2nd Lab: $199 per positive metabolite
     Expert Court Testimony: Telephonic/Virtual - No Charge
                                              In-Person: $275/hour + travel/meals
     FMCSA Clearinghouse Services: Reporting Positive Drug Tests - No Charge
                                                          Submitting Full/Limited Queries - $5.00 per query
     Background Checks/MVR's: call for pricing


	Drug & Alcohol Testing

