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DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL UNIT QTY AWARDED TO: UNIT COST UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE 

16707015

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', HEAVYWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

AUTUMN GOLD

PACON ARTKRAFT 67091 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $388.73 $71.22 NO BID $107.49 $64.49 $82.80 $86.13 $78.11

16707020

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

BLACK

PACON RAINBOW 63300 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 10 Pyramid $135.23 $50.99 NO BID $58.88 $42.64 $51.59 $52.19 $50.80

16707025

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

BRIGHT BLUE

PACON RAINBOW 63170 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $168.98 NO BID NO BID $79.66 $48.17 $83.12 $67.22 $57.71

16707030

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

BRIGHT GREEN

PACON RAINBOW 63130 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $172.48 NO BID NO BID $82.02 $50.47 $82.57 $66.63 $60.59

16707035

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

BROWN

PACON RAINBOW 63020 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 10 Pyramid $130.48 $46.40 NO BID $63.31 $38.70 $49.62 $50.61 $45.88

16707040

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

CANARY

PACON RAINBOW 63080 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $150.98 $53.77 NO BID $91.09 $45.86 $72.52 $59.27 $54.83

16707045

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

DARK BLUE

PACON RAINBOW 63180 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $136.48 $49.37 NO BID $68.14 $39.56 $50.09 $52.10 $46.95

16707055

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

EMERALD/HOLIDAY GREEN

PACON RAINBOW 63140 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $119.23 $48.05 NO BID $61.44 $41.73 $57.14 $47.42 $49.66

16707060

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

LIGHT GREEN

PACON RAINBOW 63120 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $276.23 NO BID NO BID $78.47 $46.41 $60.25 $62.67 $55.51

16707065

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

ORANGE

PACON RAINBOW 63100 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 10 Pyramid $168.23 $53.77 NO BID $70.95 $45.85 $80.69 $60.00 $54.81

16707070

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

PINK

PACON RAINBOW 63260 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $146.98 $51.45 NO BID $92.01 $44.59 $72.23 $59.51 $53.24

16707075

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

PURPLE

PACON RAINBOW 63330 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $158.73 NO BID NO BID $63.15 $45.23 $75.67 $64.95 $54.04

16707085

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

ROYAL BLUE

PACON RAINBOW 63200 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $340.10 NO BID NO BID $75.78 $45.86 $74.37 $77.36 $54.83
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16707080

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

SCARLET RED

PACON RAINBOW 63030 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 5 Pyramid $133.73 $52.62 NO BID $88.08 $41.73 DNMS $53.39 $49.66

16707090

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

SKY BLUE

PACON RAINBOW 63150 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 10 Pyramid $156.98 $53.38 NO BID $75.87 $45.24 $59.68 $60.81 $54.05

16707095

PAPER, BULLETIN BOARD, 36" X 

1000', LIGHTWEIGHT, DUO-FINISH, 

WHITE

PACON RAINBOW 63000 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

ROLL 10 Pyramid $121.98 $47.20 NO BID DNMS $38.02 $46.26 $47.22 $45.03

16707105
PAPER, CALCULATOR, 2-1/4" X 150', 

WHITE

QUILL 740102 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
ROLL 30 HiTouch $7.98 $1.00 NO BID $6.66 $0.99 $0.55 $0.61 No bid

16707130
PAPER, CARD STOCK, 8.5" X 11", 90 

LB, PACK/250, WHITE

NEEHAH  (or equal, send sample 

of other brands.)
PACK 100 HiTouch $25.98 NO BID $8.93 $11.58 NO BID $7.61 $7.76 No bid

16707390
PAPER, CONSTRUCTION, 9" X 12", 

80#, PACK/50, WHITE

PACON TRU-RAY P103026 (or 

equal, send sample of other 

brands.)

PACK 5
School 

Specialty
$11.23 $2.27 NO BID $2.22 $2.95 $1.65 $1.71 $1.51

16707430
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", 

GOLDENROD

AE COLOR 4774050 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
REAM 50 Cascade $21.98 $5.19 $6.10 $8.28 NO BID $5.77 $6.42 No bid

16707440 PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", GREEN
AE COLOR 4761050 (or equal, 

send sample of other brands.)
REAM 50 HiTouch $25.23 $6.86 $6.10 $8.11 NO BID $5.77 $6.42 No bid

16707460
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", NEON 

BLUE

NEENAH 26781 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
REAM 50 HiTouch $44.74 NO BID $9.65 $12.65 NO BID $8.02 $9.48 $12.86

16707465
PAPER, COPY, 8.5" X 11", NEON 

ORANGE

NEENAH 26721 (or equal, send 

sample of other brands.)
REAM 50 HiTouch $47.73 NO BID $9.65 $13.80 NO BID $8.09 $9.48 No bid


