
HCSD ITEM 

#
DESCRIPTION ACCEPTED BRAND & MODEL UNIT QTY AWARDED TO: UNIT COST UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE 

10500005
CLAY, MODELING, 4-COLOR, 

ASSORTED

Prang #740 or equal, send sample of 

other brands
LB 40 HiTOUCH $4.75 $1.59 $4.12 $1.67 $1.25 $1.78 NO BID

16203135

MARKER, DRY ERASE, CHISEL TIP, 

FOR WHITEBOARDS, SET/4, 4-

COLORS

ONLY SANFORD 80074 SET 700 PYRAMID $7.50 $2.49 $3.17 No Bid $2.53 $2.58 $3.05

16203150
MARKER, DRY ERASE, FINE TIP, 

SET/4, 4-COLORS
ONLY SANFORD 86074 SET 100 HiTOUCH $6.15 $2.29 $3.25 No Bid $2.14 $2.55 $3.33

16303360
PEN, ROLLER BALL, MEDIUM, GEL 

GRIP, (INST), BLACK 

Sanford #65450 or equal, send sample 

of other brands
DZ 10 QUILL $23.00 $11.49 $11.29 $20.14 DNMS $12.00 $20.48

16606030
PAPER CLIP, LARGE, 1-1/4", 10 

BOXES/CTN

Charles Leonard, Inc. #201-E or equal, 

send sample of other brands.
CTN 100 PYRAMID $4.60 $1.95 $37.62 $3.29 NO SAMPLE NO BID $2.27

16606064
PAPER CLIP, JUMBO, 2", 10 

BOXES/CTN

Charles Leonard, Inc. #301-E or equal, 

send sample of other brands.
CTN 10 HiTOUCH $11.44 $4.70 $18.12 $9.51 $4.51 NO BID $6.11

16606092
RULER, HARD PLASTIC, INCH/CM, 

12"

DAGONGREN or equal, send sample of 

other brands
EACH 60 PYRAMID $0.65 $0.20 $1.07 DNMS $0.43 $0.28 NO BID

PCARD (Fee): 

Yes/ None

PCARD (Fee): 

NO PCARD (Fee): YES/NONE

Expiration: 6 

Months

Expiration: 6 

Months

Expiration: 

MARCH 

31,2025

Expiration: 6 

Months

Expiration: 6 

Months

Expiration: 12 

Months Expiration: 6 Months

Vendor: QUILL

Vendor: 

SCHOOL 

SPECIALTY

Vendor: 

HiTOUCH

Vendor: 

NATIONAL 

ART SUPPLIES Vendor: CASCADE

 Awarded To:  Multiple Vendors

PCARD (Fee): 

NO

PCARD 

(Fee): 

Yes/5%

PCARD (Fee): 

Yes/NONE

PCARD (Fee): 

YES/NONE

BID RESPONSE AWARD 

WORKSHEET 
 BID# 24-050 

 DUE: MARCH 22, 2024 @ 2:00PM Vendor: A+

Vendor: 

PYRAMID


